Queensland

Subordinate L egislation 1992 No. 39

Clean Waters Act 1971

CLEAN WATERSAMENDMENT
REGULATION 1992

TABLE OF PROVISIONS

Section Page
1 Shorttitle . ... 1
2 Amendedregulation. .. ... ... . 1
3 Amendment of s.13 (Applicationfees) .............. ... ..., 2
4 Amendment of s.14 (Licencefees) ......... ..o, 2
5 Amendment of s.15 (Otherfees) . ... 3
Short title

1. This regulation may be cited as the Clean Waters Amendment

Regulation 1992.

Amended regulation

2. The Clean Waters Regulation 1973 is amended as set out in this

regulation.



2
Clean Waters (Amendment) Regulation 1992

Amendment of s.13 (Application fees)

3. Section 13—
omit insert
$1,545.00 $1 603
$103.00 (wherever occurring) $106
$309.00 $320
$186.00 $193
$62.00 $64
$248.00 $257
$7,440.00 $7 722
$11,470.00 $11 905

Amendment of s.14 (Licence fees)

4. Section 14—
omit insert
$309.00 $320
$103.00 $106
$412.00 $427
$12,360.00 $12 829
$19,055.00 $19 779




3
Clean Waters (Amendment) Regulation 1992

Amendment of s.15 (Other fees)
5.(1) Section 15(1)—
omit ‘$773.00", insert ‘ $802'.
(2) Section 15(2)—
omit ‘$34.00', insert ‘$35'.

ENDNOTES
Made by the Governor in Council on 5 March 1992.
Published in the Gazette on 6 March 1992.
Laid before the Legislative Assembly on . . .
The administering agency is the Department of Environment and Heritage.
[0 The State of Queensland 1992

SN .



