
Queensland

Subordinate Legislation 1993 No. 166

Carriage of Dangerous Goods by Road Act 1984

Harbours Act 1955

Motor Vehicle Driving Instruction School Act 1969

Motor Vehicles Control Act 1975

Motor Vehicles Safety Act 1980

Pollution of Waters by Oil Act 1973

Queensland Marine Act 1958

State Transport Act 1960

Traffic Act 1949

Transport Infrastructure (Roads) Act 1991

Tow-truck Act 1973

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORT (VARIATION
OF FEES) REGULATION 1993

TABLE OF PROVISIONS

Section Page

1 Short title  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .     4

2 Commencement . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .     4

3 Amended regulations . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .     4

SCHEDULE 1  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .     6

AMENDMENT OF THE BOATING FACILITIES ORDER 1992

SCHEDULE 2  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .     7

AMENDMENT OF THE CARRIAGE OF DANGEROUS GOODS
BY ROAD REGULATION 1989



2

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 3  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .     8

AMENDMENT OF THE CONSTRUCTION OF HARBOUR
WORKS (FEES) REGULATION 1992

SCHEDULE 4  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   10

AMENDMENT OF THE HARBOURS (RECLAMATION OF
LAND) REGULATION 1979

SCHEDULE 5  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   11

AMENDMENT OF THE MARINE (REGISTRATION, SURVEY,
EQUIPMENT AND LOAD LINE) REGULATION 1987

SCHEDULE 6  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   15

AMENDMENT OF THE MOTOR VEHICLE DRIVING
INSTRUCTION SCHOOL REGULATION 1988

SCHEDULE 7  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   16

AMENDMENT OF THE MOTOR VEHICLES CONTROL
REGULATION 1989

SCHEDULE 8  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   17

AMENDMENT OF THE MOTOR VEHICLES INSPECTION AND
SAFETY REGULATION 1985

SCHEDULE 9  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   20

AMENDMENT OF THE POLLUTION OF WATERS BY OIL
REGULATION 1988

SCHEDULE 10  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   21

AMENDMENT OF THE PRIVATE PLEASURE VESSELS
REGULATION 1984

SCHEDULE 11  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   22

AMENDMENT OF THE QUEENSLAND MARINE
REGULATION 1992

SCHEDULE 12  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   24

AMENDMENT OF THE QUEENSLAND MARINE (AIR
CUSHION VEHICLE) REGULATION 1972

SCHEDULE 13  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   25

AMENDMENT OF THE QUEENSLAND MARINE (CREWING)
REGULATION 1987

SCHEDULE 14  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   28

AMENDMENT OF THE QUEENSLAND MARINE (HIREBOAT)
REGULATION 1976



3

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 15  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   29

AMENDMENT OF THE QUEENSLAND MARINE (MOTOR
BOAT AND MOTOR VESSEL) REGULATION 1975

SCHEDULE 16  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   31

AMENDMENT OF THE STATE TRANSPORT REGULATION
1987

SCHEDULE 17  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   34

AMENDMENT OF THE TOW–TRUCK REGULATION 1988

SCHEDULE 18  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   35

AMENDMENT OF THE TRAFFIC REGULATION 1962

SCHEDULE 19  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .   37

AMENDMENT OF THE TRANSPORT INFRASTRUCTURE
(ROADS) REGULATION 1991



4

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

˙Short title

1. This regulation may be cited as the Department of Transport
(Variation of Fees) Regulation 1993.

˙Commencement

2. This regulation commences on 1 July 1993.

˙Amended regulations

3. Each of the following regulations is amended as set out in the
Schedule mentioned in relation to the regulation—

(a) the Boating Facilities Order 1992—Schedule 1;

(b) the Carriage of Dangerous Goods by Road Regulation
1989—Schedule 2;

(c) the Construction of Harbour Works (Fees) Regulation
1992—Schedule 3;

(d) the Harbours (Reclamation of Land) Regulation
1979—Schedule 4;

(e) the Marine (Registration, Survey, Equipment and Load Line)
Regulation 1987—Schedule 5;

(f) the Motor Vehicle Driving Instruction School Regulation
1988—Schedule 6;

(g) the Motor Vehicles Control Regulation 1989—Schedule 7;

(h) the Motor Vehicles Inspection and Safety Regulation
1985—Schedule 8;

(i) the Pollution of Waters by Oil Regulation 1988—Schedule 9;

(j) the Private Pleasure Vessels Regulation 1984—Schedule 10;

(k) the Queensland Marine Regulation 1992—Schedule 11;

(l) the Queensland Marine (Air Cushion Vehicle) Regulation
1972—Schedule 12;

(m) the Queensland Mar ine (Crewing) Regulat ion
1987—Schedule 13;



5

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

(n) t he  Queensland Marine (Hireboat) Regulation
1976—Schedule 14;

(o) the Queensland Marine (Motor Boat and Motor Vessel)
Regulation 1975—Schedule 15;

(p) the State Transport Regulation 1987—Schedule 16;

(q) the Tow-truck Regulation 1988—Schedule 17;

(r) the Traffic Regulation 1962—Schedule 18;

(s) the  Transport Infrastructure (Roads) Regulation
1991—Schedule 19.



6

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 1

†AMENDMENT OF THE BOATING FACILITIES
ORDER 1992

section 3

1. Section 5—

omit, insert—

‘Amount of fee

‘5. Subject to sections 6 and 7, the boating facilities fee is—

(a) if the vessel’s length does not exceed 10 m—$6.40 for each
metre, or part of a metre, of the vessel’s length; or

(b) if the vessel’s length exceeds 10 m but not 35 m—$64.00 plus
$10.60 for each metre, or part of a metre, by which the vessel’s
length exceeds 10 m; or

(c) if the vessel’s length exceeds 35 m—$328.30.’.

2. Section 8—

omit.



7

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 2

†AMENDMENT OF THE CARRIAGE OF
DANGEROUS GOODS BY ROAD REGULATION 1989

section 3

1. Schedule 2—

omit, insert—

‘SCHEDULE 2

‘FEES

section 32

$
‘1. Fee for an application for a licence or renewal of a licence

for each vehicle specified in the licence, if the vehicle
specified in the licence is—
(a) not more than 8 t GVM . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 36.10
(b) more than 8 t GVM . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 73.80
(c) a prime mover  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 36.10
(d) a trailer more than 1.02 t GVM  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 36.10
(e) a licence to hire—carrying vehicle  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 13.70

2. Fee for the issue of a certificate of authorisation  . . . . . . . 13.70
3. Fee for a certified copy of a licence or certificate of

authorisation  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10.90
4. Fee for a tank design approval . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 116.60’.



8

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 3

†AMENDMENT OF THE CONSTRUCTION OF
HARBOUR WORKS (FEES) REGULATION 1992

section 3

1. Section 3—

omit.

2. Schedule—

omit, insert— 

‘SCHEDULE

‘FEES

section 5

$
‘1. Fee under section 86(3) of the Act—

(a) if the sanction is sought in relation to works for private
use made under 1 application for—
(i) a boat ramp . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 106.40
(ii) a retaining wall  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 106.40
(iii) a mooring pile . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 106.40
(iv) a pontoon  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 167.30
(v) a jetty  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 167.30
(vi) any other single work  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 106.40
(vii) any combination of works (not including a

pontoon or jetty)  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 106.40



9

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 3 (continued)

(viii) any combination of works (including a pontoon
or jetty or a pontoon and jetty)  . . . . . . . . . . . . . 167.30

(b) if the sanction is in relation to works other than works
for private use and the value of the completed
works—
(i) does not exceed $10 000 . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 440.80
(ii) exceeds $10 000 but not $50 000  . . . . . . . . . . . 870.50
(iii) exceeds $50 000 but not $200 000  . . . . . . . . . . 1734.00
(iv) exceeds $200 000 but not $500 000  . . . . . . . . . 2311.00
(v) exceeds $500 000 but not $2 500 000  . . . . . . . 4811.00
(vi) exceeds $2 500 000 but not $10 000 000  . . . . . 9633.00
(vii) exceeds $10 000 000  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 15316.00

2. For the purposes of section 86(3B)(b) of the Act, the
prescribed additional fee is an amount equal to the fee
under clause 1.’.



10

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 4

†AMENDMENT OF THE HARBOURS
(RECLAMATION OF LAND) REGULATION 1979

section 3

1. Section 6(2)—

omit, insert—

‘(2) The fee payable by an applicant is—

(a) if the land is to be reclaimed for harbour, manufacturing,
industrial, residential or business purposes—$385.00 plus
$185.80 per 1 000 m2 (or part of that area) of the land to be
reclaimed but not exceeding $19 171.00; or

(b) if the land is to be reclaimed for any other purpose—$116.60.’.

2. Section 8(2)—

omit ‘$33.60’, insert ‘$34.10’.



11

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 5

†AMENDMENT OF THE MARINE (REGISTRATION,
SURVEY, EQUIPMENT AND LOAD LINE)

REGULATION 1987

section 3

1. Schedule—

omit, insert—

‘SCHEDULE

‘FEES

section 7

$
‘1. Examination of plans and specifications under

section 21(1)—
(a) class 1 or class 2 vessel, the length of which is—

(i) less than 7 m . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 45.40
(ii) 7 m or more but less than 10 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . 112.60
(iii) 10 m or more but less than 15 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 140.40
(iv) 15 m or more but less than 20 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 171.30
(v) 20 m or more but less than 25 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 194.10
(vi) 25 m or more but less than 35 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 222.00
(vii) 35 m or more but less than 50 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 262.20
(viii) 50 m or more but less than 75 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 282.90
(ix) 75 m or more but less than 100 m  . . . . . . . . . . 323.10
(x) 100 m or more  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 403.60

(b) class 3 vessel, the length of which is—
(i) less than 15 m . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 49.50



12

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 5 (continued)

(ii) 15 m or more but less than 20 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 135.20
(iii) 20 m or more but less than 25 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 170.30
(iv) 25 m or more but less than 35 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 213.70
(v) 35 m or more but less than 50 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 262.20
(vi) 50 m or more but less than 75 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 282.90
(vii) 75 m or more but less than 100 m  . . . . . . . . . . 323.10
(viii) 100 m or more  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 403.60

2. Survey of vessel under section 25(1) or (2)—
(a) class 1 or class 2 vessel, the length of which is—

(i) less than 7 m . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 90.80
(ii) 7 m or more but less than 10 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . 224.00
(iii) 10 m or more but less than 15 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 279.70
(iv) 15 m or more but less than 20 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 341.60
(v) 20 m or more but less than 25 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 390.20
(vi) 25 m or more but less than 35 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 443.90
(vii) 35 m or more but less than 50 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 524.00
(viii) 50 m or more but less than 75 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 566.00
(ix) 75 m or more but less than 100 m  . . . . . . . . . . 646.00
(x) 100 m or more  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 807.50

(b) class 3 vessel, the length of which is—
(i) less than 15 m . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 101.20
(ii) 15 m or more but less than 20 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 272.50
(iii) 20 m or more but less than 25 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 338.60
(iv) 25 m or more but less than 35 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 425.30
(v) 35 m or more but less than 50 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 524.00
(vi) 50 m or more but less than 75 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 566.00
(vii) 75 m or more but less than 100 m  . . . . . . . . . . 646.00
(viii) 100 m or more  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 807.50

3. The fee for an extension of a certificate of survey under
section 119 of the Act is 25% of the survey fee relating to
the survey set out in clause 2.

4. Survey of safety equipment under section 25(3)—
(a) class 1 or class 2 vessel, the length of which is—

(i) less than 7 m . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 64.00
(ii) 7 m or more but less than 10 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . 156.90
(iii) 10 m or more but less than 15 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 195.10
(iv) 15 m or more but less than 20 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 239.40



13

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 5 (continued)

(v) 20 m or more but less than 25 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 272.50
(vi) 25 m or more but less than 35 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 310.70
(vii) 35 m or more but less than 50 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 367.50
(viii) 50 m or more but less than 75 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 395.30
(ix) 75 m or more but less than 100 m  . . . . . . . . . . 452.10
(x) 100 m or more  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 566.00

(b) class 3 vessel, the length of which is—
(i) less than 15 m . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 70.20
(ii) 15 m or more but less than 20 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 190.90
(iii) 20 m or more but less than 25 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 237.40
(iv) 25 m or more but less than 35 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 297.30
(v) 35 m or more but less than 50 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 367.50
(vi) 50 m or more but less than 75 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 395.30
(vii) 75 m or more but less than 100 m  . . . . . . . . . . 452.10
(viii) 100 m or more  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 566.00

5. Application for issue of load line certificate under section
45 or renewal of load line certificate under section 48(1)—
(a) class 1 vessel, the length of which is—

(i) less than 7 m . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 75.30
(ii) 7 m or more but less than 10 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . 114.60
(iii) 10 m or more but less than 15 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 151.70
(iv) 15 m or more but less than 35 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 190.90
(v) 35 m or more but less than 75 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 228.20
(vi) 75 m or more but less than 100 m  . . . . . . . . . . 304.50
(vii) 100 m or more  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 379.90

(b) class 2 vessel, the length of which is—
(i) less than 10 m . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 75.30
(ii) 10 m or more but less than 15 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 114.60
(iii) 15 m or more but less than 35 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 130.00
(iv) 35 m or more but less than 75 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 151.70
(v) 75 m or more but less than 100 m  . . . . . . . . . . 190.90
(vi) 100 m or more  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 228.20

(c) class 3 vessel, the length of which is—
(i) less than 15 m . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 114.60
(ii) 15 m or more but less than 35 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 130.00
(iii) 35 m or more but less than 75 m  . . . . . . . . . . . 151.70
(iv) 75 m or more but less than 100 m  . . . . . . . . . . 190.90



14

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 5 (continued)

(v) 100 m or more  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 228.20
6. Application for issue of certificate of registration under

section 11 or renewal of certificate of registration under
section 15 for—
(a) a vessel not exceeding 4.5 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 36.10
(b) a vessel exceeding 4.5 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 61.90

7. The fee for an extension of a certificate of registration
mentioned in clause 6 is 25% of the registration fee
relating to the certificate set out in the clause.

8. Testing of prototype or specimen equipment . . . . . . . . . . 151.70
9. Duplicate record of survey under section 58  . . . . . . . . . . 75.30
10. Duplicate of any other certificate under section 58 . . . . . . 29.90
11. Certificate of recognition  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 29.90
12. If a survey has to be postponed under section 31(e), the

additional prescribed fee under section 31(e) is—
(a) the fee for the survey set out in clause 2; and
(b) any expenses properly incurred by the surveyor when

re-attending to conduct the survey.
13. The expenses mentioned in clause 12(b) are calculated

having regard to any appropriate determination in force
under the Public Service Management and Employment
Regulation 1988 or any document in substitution for it.

14. Swamp test under section 38(2)  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 75.30’.



15

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 6

†AMENDMENT OF THE MOTOR VEHICLE DRIVING
INSTRUCTION SCHOOL REGULATION 1988

section 3

1. Schedule 1—

omit, insert—

‘SCHEDULE 1

‘FEES

section 6

$
‘1. Application for a licence or renewal of licence . . . . . . . . . 118.80
2. Application for the registration, or the renewal of

registration, of a driving instruction school  . . . . . . . . . . . 529.00
3. Application for a duplicate licence  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10.20
4. Test of an applicant for a licence or the holder of a licence33.50’.



16

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 7

†AMENDMENT OF THE MOTOR VEHICLES
CONTROL REGULATION 1989

section 3

1. Schedule 1—

omit, insert—

‘SCHEDULE 1

‘FEES

section 7

$
‘1. Application for certificate of registration (fee includes

issue of a number plate) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 22.70
2. Application for certificate for renewal of registration . . . . 18.60
3. Application for search and extract from register of

recreation vehicles  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 9.30
4. Application for transfer of recreation vehicle registration  13.90
5. Replacement of a number plate  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 14.90’.



17

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 8

†AMENDMENT OF THE MOTOR VEHICLES
INSPECTION AND SAFETY REGULATION 1985

section 3

1. Schedule 1—

omit, insert—

‘SCHEDULE 1

‘FEES

section 6

$
‘1. Inspection of motor vehicle specified in Schedule 1 of the

Act under section 23(1) of the Act—
(a) taxi . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 24.80
(b) bus with a GVM not exceeding 4 t or a school bus . . 39.20
(c) any other bus with a GVM exceeding 4 t  . . . . . . . . . 46.50
(d) any other motor vehicle with a GVM not exceeding

4 t  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 24.80
(e) any other motor vehicle with a GVM exceeding 4 t

but not exceeding 14 t  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 53.70
(f) any other motor vehicle with a GVM exceeding 14 t  67.10
(g) trailer or semitrailer  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 29.90

2. Inspection of motor vehicle specified in Schedule 3 of the
Act under section 23 (3) of the Act  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 51.70



18

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 8 (continued)

3. If a motor vehicle is inspected outside normal working
hours at the request of the vehicle’s owner, the overtime
payable to, and the travelling expenses incurred by, the
inspector are payable in addition to the fee under clause 1
or 2.

4. Inspection of motor vehicle under section 9(1)(b) . . . . . . 24.80
5. Furnishing copy of inspection report under section 14(3)

of the Act . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10.90
6. Survey of plans for the alteration or modification of motor

vehicle for the purposes of section 22 of the Act . . . . . . . 43.30
7. Inspection of altered or modified motor vehicle for the

purposes of section 22 of the Act  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 24.80
8. First inspection of motor vehicle under section 24 for the

issue of certificate of roadworthiness—
(a) motor vehicle with a GVM not exceeding 4 t  . . . . . . 25.80
(b) motor vehicle with a GVM exceeding 4 t but not

exceeding 14 t  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 53.70
(c) motor vehicle with a GVM exceeding 14 t  . . . . . . . . 67.10

9. Supply of book of 50 certificates of roadworthiness or
inspection under section 23  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 36.60

10. A postage and handling charge of $4.85 is payable for
each package of up to 4 books in addition to the fee under
clause 9.

11. Supply of book of 50 certificates of modification under
section 35  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 22.70

12. Application for grant of certificate of competency under
section 42 . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 19.60

13. Application for grant of motor mechanic’s certificate
under section 43 or 44  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 30.50

14. Issue of duplicate motor mechanic’s certificate under
section 49 . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10.90

15. Approval of premises as approved inspection station
under section 38 of the Act  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 51.10

16. Application for renewal of certificate of approval of
premises as approved inspection station under
section 14(1)  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 26.80



19

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 8 (continued)

17. Approval as approved examiner of motor vehicles under
section 39 of the Act  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 14.90

18. Lodgment of notice of appeal under section 42N of the
Act  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 22.70

19. Issue of duplicate certificate or licence under section 16  . 10.90’.



20

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 9

†AMENDMENT OF THE POLLUTION OF WATERS
BY OIL REGULATION 1988

section 3

1. Section 10(1)—

omit ‘$96.60’, insert ‘$98.00’.



21

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 10

†AMENDMENT OF THE PRIVATE PLEASURE
VESSELS REGULATION 1984

section 3

1. Schedule 2—

omit, insert—

‘SCHEDULE 2

‘FEES

section 8

$
‘1. Application for, or renewal of, certificate of registration—

(a) vessel not exceeding 4.5 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 36.10
(b) vessel exceeding 4.5 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 61.90

2. Speedboat annual driving fee . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 5.20’.



22

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 11

†AMENDMENT OF THE QUEENSLAND MARINE
REGULATION 1992

section 3

1. Section 7—

omit.

2. Schedule—

omit, insert—

‘SCHEDULE

‘FEES

section 3

$
‘1. Application for examination for grant of pilotage

exemption certificate under section 170(1) of the Act  . . . 129.00
2. Grant of pilotage exemption certificate under

section 170(3)(a) of the Act . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 129.00
3. Application for variation or removal of limitations on

pilotage exemption certificate under section 170(3)(b) of
the Act  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 129.00

4. Grant of varied pilotage exemption certificate under
section 170(3)(b) of the Act . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 129.00

5. Renewal of pilotage exemption certificate under
section 170(4) of the Act  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 62.90



23

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 11 (continued)

6. Pilotage rates for the Port of Brisbane under
section 174(1) of the Act—
(a) per ton or part of a ton—

(i) for the first 10 000 ton  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 18.0c
(ii) over 10 000 ton to 20 000 ton . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10.6c
(iii) over 20 000 ton to 30 000 ton . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 7.0c
(iv) over 30 000 ton . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1.9c

(b) minimum charge  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 618.00
7. Pilotage rates for any other port under section 174(1) of

the Act—
(a) per ton or part of a ton—

(i) for the first 20 000 ton  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 8.7c
(ii) over 20 000 ton to 40 000 ton . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 5.4c
(iii) over 40 000 ton . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 3.4c

(b) minimum charge  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 312.00
8. Pilotage rates under section 174(3)(a) of the Act, per ton

or part of a ton—
(a) for the first 1 000 ton 139.001 204.002 267.003
(b) over 1 000 ton to 6 000 ton 262.001 351.002 441.003
(c) over 6 000 ton to 10 000 ton 383.001 498.002 600.003
(d) over 10 000 ton 537.001 626.002 739.003

9. Sanction of the Board to cast, place or leave buoy mooring
under section 198(1) of the Act  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 85.70

10. Conservancy dues under section 219(1) of the Act—
(a) ship in the course of an interstate voyage or coaster,

per ton or part of a ton—
(i) for the first 500 ton . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10.8c
(ii) over 500 ton  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 18.3c

(b) any other ship, per ton or part of a ton . . . . . . . . . . . . 18.3c

1 for the first 3 n mile

2 over 3 n mile up to 10 n mile

3 over 10 n mile’.



24

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 12

†AMENDMENT OF THE QUEENSLAND MARINE
(AIR CUSHION VEHICLE) REGULATION 1972

section 3

1. Schedule—

omit, insert—

‘SCHEDULE

‘FEES

section 2

$
‘1. Survey of air cushion vehicle under section 8, if the

vehicle’s length—
(a) does not exceed 5 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 87.70
(b) exceeds 5 m but not 7.5 m . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 117.60
(c) exceeds 7.5 m but not 10 m . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 181.70
(d) exceeds 10 m but not 15 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 238.40
(e) exceeds 15 m but not 20 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 359.20
(f) exceeds 20 m but not 30 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 479.00
(g) exceeds 30 m . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 597.00

2. Examination for certificate of competency under
section 19(b)  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 119.80

3. Examination for certificate of competency under
section 19(c)  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 28.90

4. Grant of certificate of competency under section 21  . . . . 19.60
5. Renewal of certificate of competency under section 23  . . 28.90
6. Issue of replacement certificate under section 26 . . . . . . . 19.60’.



25

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 13

†AMENDMENT OF THE QUEENSLAND MARINE
(CREWING) REGULATION 1987

section 3

1. Schedule 1—

omit, insert—

‘SCHEDULE 1

‘FEES

section 7

$
‘1. Examination fee for certificate of competency—

(a) Master Class 3, Master Class 3 (Limited to sail as
Chief Mate) and Skipper Grade 1—
(i) full certificate  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 143.50

(ii) for each subject taken separately . . . . . . . . . . . . 25.80
(b) Master Class 4, Mate Class 4 and Skipper Grade 2—

(i) full certificate  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 143.50
(ii) for each subject taken separately . . . . . . . . . . . . 25.80

(c) Master Class 5 and Skipper Grade 3—
(i) full certificate  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 98.00
(ii) for each subject taken separately . . . . . . . . . . . . 20.60

(d) Coxswain and Coxswain (Fishing)  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 45.40
(e) Marine Engineer Class 3—

(i) full certificate  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 179.70
(ii) for each subject taken separately . . . . . . . . . . . . 41.30



26

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 13 (continued)

(f) Marine Engine Driver Grade 1—
(i) full certificate  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 115.60
(ii) for each subject taken separately . . . . . . . . . . . . 41.30

(g) Marine Engine Driver Grade 2—
(i) full certificate  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 83.60
(ii) for each subject taken separately . . . . . . . . . . . . 41.30

(h) Marine Engine Driver Grade 3—
(i) full certificate  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 83.60
(ii) for each subject taken separately . . . . . . . . . . . . 41.30

(i) Marine Engine Driver Grade III Q (Fishing)—
(i) full certificate  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 71.30
(ii) for each subject taken separately . . . . . . . . . . . . 31.00

(j) Marine Engine Driver Grade IV Q (Fishing)—
(i) full certificate  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 71.30
(ii) for each subject taken separately . . . . . . . . . . . . 31.00

(k) Marine Engine Driver Grade IV Q (Trading)—
(i) full certificate  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 97.00
(ii) for each subject taken separately . . . . . . . . . . . . 31.00

(l) Marine Engine Driver Grade 2 upgrade from Harbour
and River Engine Driver Grade 1 (Motor), Coastal
Engine Driver Grade 2 (Motor) and Marine Motor
Engineer Grade B—
(i) full certificate  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 71.30
(ii) for each subject taken separately . . . . . . . . . . . . 31.00

(m)Marine Engine Driver Grade 1 (Motor) upgrade from Coastal Engine Driver Grade 1 (Motor) and Marine
Motor Engineer Grade A—

(i) full certificate  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 
71.30

(ii) for each subject taken separately . . . . . . . . . . . . 31.00
2. Application for recognition of a certificate of competency

for service issued by a marine authority  . . . . . . . . . . . . . 39.20
3. Application for revalidation of a certificate of competency 25.80
4. Application for a certificate of service  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 39.20
5. Application for a duplicate certificate . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 19.60
6. Application for an eyesight test certificate  . . . . . . . . . . . . 13.40
7. Application for a record service book  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 5.10



27

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 13 (continued)

8. Application for a permit to act as duly certificated Master
or Officer under section 27(1) of the Act . . . . . . . . . . . . . 25.80

9. Application for endorsement of a certificate  . . . . . . . . . . 25.80’.



28

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 14

†AMENDMENT OF THE QUEENSLAND MARINE
(HIREBOAT) REGULATION 1976

section 3

1. Schedule—

omit, insert—

‘SCHEDULE

‘FEES

section 8

$
‘1. Application for licence under section 5 or for renewal of

licence under section 7(1)  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 28.90
2. Survey of hireboat under section 5, if the hireboat’s

length—
(a) does not exceed 3 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 23.80
(b) exceeds 3 m but not 5 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 28.90
(c) exceeds 5 m but not 8 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 35.10
(d) exceeds 8 m but not 10 m  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 46.50
(e) exceeds 10 m . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 58.90

3. Testing prototype hireboat  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 58.90
4. Testing item of equipment under section 5  . . . . . . . . . . . 28.90’.



29

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 15

†AMENDMENT OF THE QUEENSLAND MARINE
(MOTOR BOAT AND MOTOR VESSEL)

REGULATION 1975

section 3

1. Part 3, section 31(h)(iii)—

omit ‘$128.10’, insert ‘$130.00’.

2. Part 3, section 31(h)(iii) and (m)(ii)—

omit ‘$52.90’, insert ‘$53.70’.

3. Part 4, section 4—

omit, insert—

‘4.(1) The annual registration fee for a drive-yourself motor boat is—

(a) if the length of the motor boat does not exceed 4.5 m—$36.10; or

(b) if the length of the motor boat exceeds 4.5 m—$61.90.

‘(2) The annual survey fee for a drive-yourself motor boat is—

(a) if the length of the motor boat does not exceed 6 m—$35.10; or

(b) if the length of the motor boat exceeds 6 m but not
10 m—$58.90; or

(c) if the length of the motor boat exceeds 10 m but not
15 m—$87.70; or

(d) if the length of the motor boat exceeds 15 m but not
20 m—$116.60; or

(e) if the length of the motor boat exceeds 20 m but not
25 m—$175.50; or



30

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 15 (continued)

(f) if the length of the motor boat exceeds 25 m but not
35 m—$204.40; or

(g) if the length of the motor boat exceeds 35m—$234.40’.

4. Part 5, section 7(i)—

omit ‘$26.40’, insert ‘$26.80’.

5. Part 6, section 25—

omit ‘$44.70’, insert ‘$45.40’.



31

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 16

†AMENDMENT OF THE STATE TRANSPORT
REGULATION 1987

section 3

1. Schedule 5—

omit, insert—

‘SCHEDULE 5

‘FEES

section 7

$
‘1. The fees set out opposite the following matters are the

fees payable in relation to a licence to hire for a taximeter
cab—
(a) for the issue or renewal of a licence (including any

examination, test and sealing of cable and taximeter)  202.30
(b) for the transfer of a licence . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 81.50

2. The fees set out opposite the following matters are the
fees payable in relation to a licence to hire for an exempted
cab—
(a) for the issue or renewal of a licence . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 101.20
(b) for the transfer of a licence . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 43.30

3. The fees set out opposite the following matters are the
fees payable in relation to a licence to hire for a private
hire car—
(a) for the issue or renewal of—

(i) an unrestricted licence . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 318.00



32

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 16 (continued)

(ii) a restricted licence . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 175.00
(b) for the transfer of a licence . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 81.50

4. The fees set out opposite the following matters are the
fees payable in relation to a licence to hire for a carrying
vehicle—
(a) for the issue or renewal of a licence—

(i) for a trailer with gross vehicle mass—
(A) not exceeding 1.02 t . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 16.30
(B) exceeding 1.02 t . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 40.70

(ii) for a motorcycle  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 16.30
(iii) for a vehicle (not otherwise specifically provided

for)—
(A) up to and including 2.1 t load capacity . . . . 40.70
(B) over 2.1 t and up to and including 4.1 t load

capacity  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 57.00
(C) over 4.1 t and up to and including 10.1 t

load capacity  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 99.70
(D) over 10.1 t load capacity  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 190.20

(b) for the transfer of a licence—
(i) for a trailer with gross vehicle mass—

(A) not exceeding 1.02 t . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 16.30
(B) exceeding 1.02 t . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 40.70

(ii) for a motorcycle  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 16.30
(iii) for a vehicle (not otherwise specifically provided

for)—
(A) up to and including 4.1 t load capacity . . . . 40.70
(B) over 4.1 t load capacity  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 72.20

5. The fees set out opposite the following matters are the
fees payable in relation to those matters—
(a) for an endorsement or amendment (other than a

change of address or an alteration of a minor nature)
on or to a licence to hire (other than a licence to hire
for taximeter cab) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10.20

(b) for a replacement licence  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10.20
(c) for a hire driver’s licence—

(i) on the issue or renewal of a licence . . . . . . . . . . 41.30
(ii) on the endorsement of a licence (other than a



33

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 16 (continued)

change of address or an alteration of a minor
nature) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10.20

(iii) on the amendment of a licence  . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10.20
(d) for an authorised log book . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 11.90

6. If the Director-General proposes to issue or renew a
licence for a period of less than 12 months, the fee
payable is one-twelfth of the prescribed fee for each
month or part of a month in relation to which the
Director-General proposes to issue or renew that licence.’.



34

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 17

†AMENDMENT OF THE TOW–TRUCK REGULATION
1988

section 3

1. Schedule 3—

omit, insert—

‘SCHEDULE 3

‘FEES

section 7

$
‘1. Application for a licence or renewal of a licence, for each

tow truck  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 204.00
2. Application for a permit to tow motor vehicles, for each 3

month period or part of a 3 month period  . . . . . . . . . . . . 58.90
3. Application for a driver’s certificate or renewal of a

driver’s certificate  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 25.40
4. Application for an assistant’s certificate or renewal of an

assistant’s certificate  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 25.40
5. Application for a driver’s permit, for each 3 month period

or part of a 3 month period  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10.20
6. Application for an assistant’s permit, for each 3 month

period or part of a 3 month period . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10.20
7. Application for a duplicate licence or permit  . . . . . . . . . . 25.40
8. Application for a duplicate driver’s or assistant’s

certificate or permit  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10.20’.



35

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 18

†AMENDMENT OF THE TRAFFIC REGULATION
1962

section 3

1. Schedule E—

omit, insert—

‘SCHEDULE E

‘FEES

section 172

$
‘1. Licence for a stall, stand or standing vehicle—

(a) in the area of the City of Brisbane—
(i) annually  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 702.00

(ii) quarterly  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 245.60
(iii) monthly  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 101.20

(b) in the area of a city, other than the City of Brisbane—
(i) annually  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 351.00
(ii) quarterly  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 129.00
(iii) monthly  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 49.50

(c) elsewhere than in the area of a city—
(i) annually  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 76.40
(ii) quarterly  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 26.80
(iii) monthly  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 12.90

2. Itinerant vendor’s licence—
(a) annually  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 76.40
(b) quarterly . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 26.80



36

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 18 (continued)

3. Permit to carry an advertisement, placard, board, notice or
sign for business advertising, for each month or part of a
month  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 12.90

4. Permit to use an electrical or mechanical appliance,
apparatus or device that amplifies or reproduces words,
music or other sounds for advertising purposes  . . . . . . . 12.90

5. Itinerant musician’s permit, for each month or part of a
month  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1.00

6. Annual traffic improvement fee . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 20.20
7. Permit to learn to drive a motor vehicle . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 11.90
8. Practical driving test for the issue of a driver’s licence  . . 26.00
9. Application for, or renewal of, a driver’s licence, other

than a permit to learn to drive a motor vehicle, for each
year or part of a year  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 9.50

10. Duplicate driver’s licence . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 11.90
11. Extract from the records of the particulars of a driver’s

licence  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 11.90
12. Extract from the records of the particulars of a driver’s

traffic histories . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 11.90
13. Application for, or renewal of, a pilot vehicle licence  . . . 169.30
14. Duplicate pilot vehicle licence  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 20.60
15. Application for, or renewal of, a pilot vehicle driver’s

licence  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 20.60
16. Duplicate pilot vehicle driver’s licence . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 7.00
17. Fee under section 37(1) of the Act . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 62.90
18. Application for colour prints of the photographic evidence

of a camera-detected offence  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 11.90’.



37

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

¡SCHEDULE 19

†AMENDMENT OF THE TRANSPORT
INFRASTRUCTURE (ROADS) REGULATION 1991

section 3

1. Schedule 1—

omit, insert—

‘SCHEDULE 1

‘FEES

section 1.04

‘PART 1

‘Vehicle Registration Fees for a 12 month period

(Fees for a greater or lesser period to be adjusted accordingly)

$
‘1. Passenger car—

(a) 1, 2 or 3 cylinders, electric
or steam . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 112.60

(b) 4 cylinders or 2 rotors  . . . 144.00
(c) 5 or 6 cylinders  . . . . . . . . 223.00
(d) 7 or 8 cylinders  . . . . . . . . 313.80
(e) 9, 10, 11 or 12 cylinders  . 368.50



38

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 19 (continued)

2. Commercial vehicle—
(a) RGVM not exceeding 4 t . Fee as prescribed for a passenger

car
(b) RGVM exceeding 4 t . . . . 254.50

plus $97.40 for each tonne, or part
of a tonne, by which the RGVM
exceeds 4 t

3. Truck tractor, prime mover,
B-Double or road train—
(a) RGCM not exceeding

6.67 t  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Fee as prescribed for a passenger
car

(b) RGCM exceeding 6.67 t
but not exceeding 7 t  . . . . 487.20

(c) RGCM exceeding 7 t but
not exceeding 24 t  . . . . . . 487.20

plus $82.60 for each tonne, or part
of a tonne, by which the RGCM
exceeds 7 t

(d) RGCM exceeding 24 t but
not exceeding 41 t  . . . . . . 1 891.40

plus $35.10 for each tonne, or part
of a tonne, by which the RGCM
exceeds 24 t

(e) RGCM exceeding 41 t but
not exceeding 42.5 t . . . . . 2 488.10

plus $49.50 for each 0.1 of a
tonne, or part of 0.1 of a tonne, by
which the RGCM exceeds 41 t

(f) RGCM exceeding 42.5 t  . 3 230.60
plus $23.80 for each tonne, or part
of a tonne, by which the RGCM
exceeds 42.5 t

4. Motorised caravan or bus—
(a) RGVM not exceeding 4 t . Fee as prescribed for a passenger

car



39

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 19 (continued)

(b) RGVM exceeding 4 t . . . . 288.00
plus $62.90 for each tonne, or part
of a tonne, by which the RGVM
exceeds 4 t

5. Mobi le  machinery or
equipment  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 77.40

plus $29.90 for each tonne, or part
of a tonne, by which the loaded
mass exceeds 1 t

6. Tractor  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 41.30
7. Motorcycle . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 46.50
8. Trailer or caravan—

(a) loaded mass not exceeding
1.02 t  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 41.80

(b) loaded mass exceeding
1.02 t with tare—
(i) not exceeding 5 t  . . . 82.60
(ii) exceeding 5 t  . . . . . . 270.50

‘PART 2

‘Concessional Vehicle Registration Fees for a 12 month period

$
‘1. Ambulance  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 37.10
2. A motor vehicle with a load

capacity exceeding 4 t owned
by a primary producer and
used only in that person’s
business as a primary producer25% of the fee calculated under

Part 1



40

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 19 (continued)

3. A vehicle owned by a primary
producer used only in that
person’s business as a primary
producer subject to terms and
conditions that may be
imposed by the Corporation
limiting the distance and roads
on which the vehicle may be
used  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 38.20

4. 1 motor vehicle (other than a
motorcycle or mobi le
machinery or equipment)
registered in the name of a
holder of a Queensland
Government Seniors Card, in
circumstances determined in
writing by the Corporation . . . 50% of the fee calculated under

Part 1
5. A motor vehicle (other than a

commercial vehicle, motorised
caravan or bus each with a
RGVM or RGCM exceeding
4 t or mobile machinery or
equipment), in circumstances
determined in writing by the
Corporation  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 37.10

6. A commercial vehicle,
motorised caravan or bus each
with a RGVM or RGCM
exceeding 4 t or mobile
machinery or equipment, in
circumstances determined in
writing by the Corporation . . . 25% of the fee calculated under

Part 1 or $37.10, whichever is the
greater amount



41

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 19 (continued)

‘PART 3

‘Plate fees

$
‘1. Issue of—

(a) ordinary personalised
number plates  . . . . . . . . . 250.00

(b) traditional personalised
number plates  . . . . . . . . . 270.00

(c) prestige personalised
number plates  . . . . . . . . . 1 500.00

plus manufacturing costs
(d) a dealer’s plate  . . . . . . . . . 237.40
(e) any other number plate  . . 14.90

2. Replacement of—
(a) a dealer’s plate  . . . . . . . . . 54.70
(b) any other number plate  . . 14.90

3. Replacement of a number plate,
or pair of number plates,
bearing the same registration
number as the replaced plate or
plates  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 14.90

plus manufacturing costs



42

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 19 (continued)

‘PART 4

‘Miscellaneous Fees

$
‘1. Transfer of registration  . . . . . 13.90
2. Transfer of personalised

number plates  . . . . . . . . . . . . 51.70
3. Issue of limited use permit, for

each day . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 13.90
4. Issue of a certificate for limited

use  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 38.20
5. Issue of a permit under section

3.06—
(a) for a single trip . . . . . . . . . 49.50
(b) for a specified period  . . . . 187.90

6. Supply of an extract from the
register of vehicles by
electronic tape exchange—
(a) a full extract  . . . . . . . . . . . 5.20
(b) an extract excluding—

(i) the owner’s name and
address; and

(ii) the insurer of the
vehicle under the Motor
Vehicles Insurance Act
1936  . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2.00

plus computer run costs of
$150.00 per hour and an
administration fee of $100.00 per
tape, irrespective of the number of
extracts on a particular tape



43

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 19 (continued)

(c) an extract excluding—
(i) the owner’s name and

address; and
(ii) the insurer of the

vehicle under the Motor
Vehicles Insurance Act
1936; and

(iii) the expiry date of the
registration . . . . . . . . . 1.00

plus computer run costs of
$150.00 per hour and an
administration fee of $100.00 per
tape, irrespective of the number of
extracts on a particular tape

(d) an extract to be used in
recalling vehicles for safety
purposes  . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1.00

plus an administration fee of
$100.00 per tape, irrespective of
the number of extracts on a
particular tape

7. Supply of an extract from the
register of vehicles through
Citec’s Publ ic Access
System1—
(a) if the extract relates to

information as at the
date of the application $9.202 $7.003 $5.104

(b) if the extract relates to
information as at any
other date $14.202 $12.503 $10.004

(c) if the request is to
search using the name
and address of a
person in whose name
a vehicle is registered $14.202 $12.503 $10.004



44

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

SCHEDULE 19 (continued)

8. Supply of a declaration by the
Corporation verifying the
information recorded in the
register of vehicles supplied to
an applicant under item 6 . . . . 14.40

9. Supply of an extract from the
register of vehicles, other than
to an applicant under items 6 or
7—
(a) if the extract relates to

information as at the date of
the application  . . . . . . . . . 9.30

(b) if the extract relates to
information as at any other
date  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 14.40

10. Surcharge for processing an
application for registration for
less than 1 year (other than an
application for registration up
to a common expiry date)  . . . 25.80

1 To determine the fee payable by a person for an extract supplied in a
particular week the total number of extracts supplied in the week is taken
to be the total number of extracts of any type supplied to the person in the
week.

2 per extract if less than 50 extracts per week (Monday to Sunday)

3 per extract if 50 to 200 extracts per week (Monday to Sunday)

4 per extract if more than 200 extracts per week (Monday to Sunday)’.



45

Department of Transport (Variation of Fees) No. 166, 1993

ENDNOTES

1. Made by the Governor in Council on 27 May 1993.

2. Notified in the Gazette on 28 May 1993.

3. Laid before the Legislative Assembly on . . .

4. The administering agency is the Department of Transport.

  The State of Queensland 1993


