
I 

PUBLIO A 
OF TB,E 

P A.RLIAMENT OF QUEENSLAND, 
3° EDWARDI VII. 

ACTS. 

An Act to Amend the "Acts Shortening Act of 3 Edw. VII. 

1867," and for other purposes. T~~'1~~s 
SHORTENING 

[ 
AOT 

ASSENTED TO 13TH NOVEMBER, 1903.J AMENDMENT 
ACT OF 1903. 

B E it enacted by the King's Most Excellent Majesty, 
by and with the advice and consent of the Legis

lative Council and Legislative Assembly of Queensland in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same,· 
as follows :-

1. This Act may be cited as "The Acts Shortening Shorttitlelmd 

Act Amendment Act of 190;~," and shall be read.and con- construction. 

strued with and as an amendment of the" Acts Sh01'tening 
Act of 1867,"* hereinafter called the Principal Act. This 

. Act and that Act may be cited together as "The Acts 
Shortening Acts." . 

Amendments of Principal Act. 
2. Sections two and tliree of the Principal Act are Repeal 

repealed, and the follo wing sections are inserted in lieu °N£ 361 Vic2· 3 
th f - o. ,ss. , . 

ereo :-
[2.J (i.) ffhe repeal of an Act or part thereof by which E1I'ect of 

a previous Act or.p~rt thereof was r~p~aled shall not have [~~e~~:-vI~~: 
the effect of revIvmg such last-mentIOned Act or part c. 63, ss. 11, 

thereof without express words. . 38.J 

(ii.) Where an Act repeals in the whole or in part a 
former Act, then, unless the contrary intention appears, the 
repeal shall not- . 

(a) Revive anything not in force or existing at the 
time at which the repeal takes effect; or 

• 31 Vie. No. 6, supra, page 1. 



8598 ACTS. 

Acts Skortenin.q Act Amendment Act. 3 EDW. VII. No. 10, 

(b) Affect the previous operation of any Act so 
repealed, or anything duly done or suffered 
under any Act so repealed; or 

(c) Affect any right, IJrivilege, obligation, or liability 
. acquired, accrued, or incurred under any Act 
so repealed; or . 

(d) Affect any penalty, forfeiture, or punishment. 
incurred in respect of any offence committed 
against any Act so repealed; or 

(e) Affect any investigation, legal proceeding, or 
remedy in respect of any such right, privi
lege, obligation, liability, penalty, forfeiture, or 
punishment as aforesaid; 

and any such investigation, legal .proceeding, or remedy 
may be instituted, continued, or enforced, and any such 
penalty, forfeiture, or punishment may be imposed, as if 
the repealing Act had not been passed. 

(iii.) Where an Act repeals in the whole or in part a 
former Act and substitutes provisions in lieu thereof, the 
repealed provisions shall, unless the contrary intention 
appears, remain in force until the substituted provisions 
come into operation. 

References to (iv.) Where an Act repeals and re-enacts with or 
repea.led without modification any provisions of a former Act, 
provisions. 

references in any other Act to the provisions so repealed 
shall, unless the contrary intention appears, be construed 
as references to the provisions so re-enacted. 

Expiration of [3.J The expiration of an Act shall not affect any 
.!.et. civil proceeding previously commenced under such' Act, 

but every such proceeding may, unless the contrary inten
tion appears in such Act, be continued and everything in 
relation thereto be done in aB. respects as if the Act con· 
tinued in force. 

3. After section seven of the Principal Act, the 
following section is inserted :-

Exercise of [7 A. J When an Act is not to come into operation 
statutory immediately on the passing thereof, and confers power to 
~~~r;n make any appointment, to make, grant, or issue any 
passing and instrument (including any rules, regulations, or by-laws), 
commence- t' ti t 'b f to d th th' ment of Act. 0 gIve nO ces, 0 prescrl e orms, or 0 any 0 er mg 
[5~& 5~i~ct. for the purposes of the Act, that power may, unless the 
e. ,s.. • contrary intention appears, be exercised at any time after 

the passing of the Act for the purpose of bringing the Act 
into opemtion at the commencement thereof: 



ACTS. 

1903. Acts Shortenin.q Act Amendment Ad. 

Provided that any instrument made under the power 
shall not, unless the contrary intention appears in the Act, 
or the contrary is necessary for bringing the Act into 
operation, come into operation until the Act comes into 
operation. 

4. The following provisions are added to section eleven Amend~f!nt, 
of the .Principal Act:- of 31 VlC. 

. • • . No. 6, 8. 11. 
ExpressIOns referrmg to wrItmg shall, unless the" Writing.': 

contrary intention appears, be construed as including ~~~:, ~.326~Jt. 
references to printing, lithography, photography, and other 
modes of representing or reproducing words in a visible form. 

Where an Act whenever passed authorises or requires Service by 

any document to be served by post, whether ~he expression I~~t.& 53 Vict . 
.. serve" or the expression "give" or "send' or any other c. 63, s. 26.J 

expression is used, then, unless the contrary intention 
appears, the service shall be deemed to be effected by 
properly addressing, prepaying, and posting a letter con-
taining the document, and, unless the contrary is proved, 
to have been effected at the time at which the letter woul~ 
be delivered in the ordinary course of post. 

5. After section twelve of the Principal Act, the 
following section is inserted :-

[12A.] Where any Act whenever passed confers power Constructio. 
to make, grant, or issue any instrument-that is to say, ~!ktsat~~~ry 
any proclamation, Order in Council, order, warrant, letters [112 & 53 Vict. 

• patent, commission, rules, regulations, or by-laws-expres- Co 63, s. 31.J 

sions used in the instrument shall, unless the contrary 
intention appears, have the same respective meanings as in 
the Act conferring the power. 

6. In section nineteen of the Principal Act after the A.mendmeuf; 
word" orders" the word" by-laws" is inserted. ~o~~,'::\9. 

7. After section twenty-nine of the Principal Act, the 
following section is inserted :-

[29A.] (1.) When by any Act whenever passed anyPrintingo£ 
section or schedule or any word or words is or are directed ~mlntment'l 
to be inserted in or omitted from any p~evious Act or any In c 11., 
section or schedule thereof, or to be substituted for or 
inserted in lieu of any section or schedule, or any word or 
words forming part or the whole of any section or schedule 
of any .previous Act, then in all copies of the Act so 
amended printed by the Government Printer the section or 
schedule or word or words shall be inserted or omitted or 
substituted in accordance with such direction, and all 
necessary consequential amendments of marginal notes, 



• ACTS. 

A'Jts Slwrtening AM Amendment Act. 3 EDW. VII. No. 10,· 

headings, and divisions shall be made. And references 
shall be made in the margin to the section or sectio:ds of 
the Act by which such amendments arP. made: 

Provided that no amendment shall merely by force of 
such direction have any retrospective operation. 

Abrogated (2.) Whenever any enactment in any Act relating to' 
provisi~n8. the practice or procedure of the Supreme Court has been, 

or shall hereafter be in pursuance of statutory authority in 
that behalf abrogated by Rules of the Supreme Court,; 
then in all copies of such Act printed by the Government 
Printer the enactment so abrogated shall be omitted, and' 
reference shall be made in the margin to the Rule of 
Court whereby such abrogation was made. 

Short Titles. 
Citation of 8. (1.) Each of the Acts mentioned in the First 
t:~tl;:r8t Schedule to this Act may, without prejudice to any other 

mode of citation, be cited by the short title therein 
mentioned in that behalf. 

Citation of (2.) Each of the groups of Acts mentioned in the 
~rosupso~ Acts Second Schedule to this Act may, without prejudice to any 
~h:~~e. other mode of citation, be cited by the c~llective title 

therein mentioned in that behalf. 
'If any Act passed after this Act is directed to be read 

with any of the groups of Acts mentioned in the Second 
. Schedule to this Act, that group shall he construed as 
including that Act, and the year in which that Act is passed 
shall be substituted for the last year stated in the collective 
title of the group and so on as often as a subsequent Act 
is added to the group. 

Ci~tion ~~ .. 9. Whenever a proposed Act having passed both 
Acts ~eserv~d Houses of Parliament is then reserved for His MaJ' esty's 
b~ . 
Majesty's assent, and such assent is not proclaimed In the same year 
assent. in which such proposed Act was so reserved, such Act 

Amendment 
of certain 
errors by· 
Third 
Schedule. 

shall be cited in the short title thereof as of the year 
in which such assent was proclaimed, notwithstanding that 
the short title in the said Act is stated to be of a different 
year, and such short title shallbe amended accordingly. 

Statute Law Revision. 
10. The verbal errors in the enactments mentioned in' 

the Third Schedule to this Act are corrected in the manner 
in the said: Sohedule indicated. 



ACTS. 

1903. Acts Shortening Act Amendment Act. 

FIRST SCHEDULE. 

SnORT TITLES. 

Year and Number. I Title. 

S Geo .. IV. No. 2 An Act for preventing the MischiefS! 
arising from the printing and publishing 
Newspapers and PapE:'rs of a like nature 
by pprsons not known and for regulating 
the printing and publication of such 
Papers in other r,rspect8 and als0 for 
restraining the Abuses arising from the 
publiration of Blasphemousand Seditious 
Libels. 

Short Title. 

The Printing Act of 
1827. 

/l 

·8 Geo. IV. No. 5 .An Act for preventing the printing and The Printing Act of 
pllbliRhing of Books and Papers by 1827 (No. 2). 

'9 Geo. IV. N@. 3 

~9 Geo. IV. No. 8 

10 Geo,IV.No.9 

persons not known. 

An Act to enable the Proprietors of a 
certain Banking Company heretofore 
carried on at Sydney under the name 
and designation of "'1'he Ba.nk of New 
South Wales" common Iv called the Old 
Hank of New South Wales to Sue and 
and be Sued in the name of the Prel'<i
dent for the time being' of the !laid 
Bank. A nd also to enable the Pro
prietors of a certain Banking Company 
to be established in Sydney under the 
Name Style and Firm of the Bank of 
New South Wales commonlv called 
"The New Bank of New South' Wales" 
to Sue and be Sued in like manner in 
the name of the PreRident for the time ' 
being and for other purposes tht-rein 
mentioned. 

An Act for enablin~ persons holding certain 
Public Offices in New South Wales to 
take Apprentices to serve nnder them 
and their Successors in Office and for 
regulating all matters relating t'l Masters 
and Apprentice". 

An .A ct declaring that a certain .A et of 
Parliament passed in the tentn year of 
the reign of His MajeRty King George 
the Fourth intituled "An Act jor the 
relief of His Majest,y's Roman Oatholic 
Subiects" extends to and is in force in 
the Colony of New South Wales. 

The Bank of New South 
Wales Act of 1828. 

The Apprentic~s Act 
of 1828 .. 

The Roman Oath o lit! 
Relief Act of 1830. 



• 8602 ACTS. 

Acts Shortenin.'1 Act Amendment Act. 3EDw. VII. No. 10, 

FIRST SCHEDULE-continued. 

SHORT TITLES-()ontinued. 

Year and Number. Title. 

4 Wm. IV. No. 5 An Act for Appointing the Fees to be 
ta ken in the several Courts of Polict' 
and Petty Sessions and by the Clerks of 
Justices acting singly in the Colony of 
New South Wales. 

5Wm.IV.No.1O An Act for removing doubts re~re('ting 
the application to New South Wales of 
the Laws and Statutes of England 
relating to Usury and to limit and 
define the rate of Interest which may 
be recovered in cases where it hath not 
been previously agreed on between the 
parties. 

Short Title. 

Tlte pp,ttySessions llees' 
Act of 1833. 

The Usury 
1834. 

Act of' 

6 Wm. IV. No. 2 Au Act for Regulating Stage Carriage!'! in The Stage Garria'les 
New South Wales. . Act of 1835. 

SWm.IV.No.1S An Act to Remove Doubts concerning the The Grown Landg-
Validity of Grants of Land in New Grants .Act of1836. 
South Wales. 

8Wm.IV.No.7 An Act to regulate the temporal affairs of 
Presbyterian Churches and Chapels con
nected with the Church of Scotland in 
the Colony. of New South Wales. 

2 Vic. No. 2 An Act for regulating the Police in the 
Towns of Parramatta Windsor Mait
land Bathurst and other Towns respec
tively and for removing and preventing 
Nuisances and Obstructions and for the 
better alignment of Streets therein. 

2 Vic. No. 7 An Act to regulate the temporal affairil of 
the Religiou<! Societies denominated 
Wesleyan Methodists, Independents, and 
Baptists. 

2 Vic. No. 20 An Act to Amend an Act intituled "An 
Act jor preventing the mischiefs arisin.'1 
jrom the printing and publishing News
papers and Papers of a like nature b!J 
persons not known and for re.'1ulatinq 
the printin.'1 and publication qf such 
Papers in other respects and also for 
restraining the abuses arising from the 
publiGation of blasphemous and seditious 
Libels." 

The Presbyterian 
Ohur()h Act of 1837. 

The Police Act of 1838. 

The Wesle.yan Metho
dists, Independents, 
and Baptists Ohur
ches Act of 1838. 

The Printing Acts
Amendment Act of 
1838. 



ACTS. 8600 

1903. Acts Shortenin.q Act Amendment Act. 

FIRST SCHEDULE-continued. 

SHORT TITLEs-continued. 

Year and Number. Title. Short Title. 

------- --~-----~- _._. __ .. __ ._---- ----------

3 Vie. No. 21 

4 Vie. No. 2 

An Act to make good certain Contracts' 
which have been or may bp, entered into 
by certain Banking and ot,her Copartner
ships. 

An Act for enabling the principal Officers 
of Her Majesty's Ordnance to hold 
Estates and Property in the Colony of 
New South Wales for Military Purposes 
and for Granting certain other powers 
to the said principal Officers and respec
tive Officers resident in the said Colony . 

• 

The Oompanies Act 0/' 
1839. 

The Military Lands 
.!ld of" 1840. 

4 Vic. No. 13 An Act to Provide for the Periodical Pub- The Banking Oompanies 
lication of the Liabilities and Assets of .!lot of 1840. 
Banks in New South Wales and its 
Dependencies and the Registration of, 
the NamE's of the Proprietors thereof. I 

4 Vic. No. 17 An Act for the further and better Rpgllla- I The Water Police Act 

4 Vic. No. 18 

5 Vie. No. 6 

5 Vic. No. 14 

5 Vic. No. 19 

tion and Government of Seamen within I of 1840. 
the Colonv of New South Wales and it>! 
Dependen"'cies and for Establishing a 
Water Police. 

An Act to amend an Act intituled ,. An 
.!lot to regulate the temporal affairs of 
the Presbyterian Oh,ltrch,'s and chapels 
oonnected with the Ohurch of" Scotland in 
the Oolony of New South Wales." 

An Act to prohibit shooting for Sport 
Pleasure or Profit on Sunday. 

An Act for rendering a Notarial Copy of 
an Exemplification of the Charter of 
the "Bank of Australasia" Evidence in 
all Courts of Law Equity Admiralty and 
Vice-Admiraltv and in all Courts of 
Inferior Jurisdiction in the Colony of 
New South Wales. 

An A ct to repeal Sf) much of an Act intituled 
"tln Act for preventing the misohiefs 
arisinq/rom the printing and publishinq 
Newspapers and Papers of a like nature 
b.'1f persons not known and for regulating 
the printing and publication of suoh 
Papers in other respect.~ and also for 
restraining the abuses arisin.q from the 
publication of blasphemous and seditious 
Libels" as relates to the sentence of 
banishment on a second cenviction and 
further to amend the same. 

The Presbyterian 
Ohurch Act .!lmend
ment Act of 1840. 

The Sunday Observance 
Act ol1841. 

The Bank of .!lus
tralasia .!lct of 1841. 

The Printing Act8 
Amendment Act of 
1842. 

• 



8604 ACTS. 

Acts Shortenin.q Act Amendment Act. 3 Enw. VII. No. 10, 

FIHST SCHEDULE-continued. 

SHORT TITLEs-continued. 

·)'8..,. and Number. I. Title. Short Title. 

5 Vic. No. 24 An Act to Amend an Act intituled "An The Banking Oompanies 
Act Amendment Act 
of 1842. 

Act to Provide j or the Periodical Pu bli
cation of Liabilities and Assets of Banks 
in New South WaleR and its dependen
cies anctthe Registration of the Namefil 
of the Proprietors thereof." 

6 Vic. No. 2 An .Act for furtht'r Facilitating Proceed- The Oompanies (Pro
cess) Act of 1842. ings by and against all Banking and 

other Companie~ in the Colony entitled 
to ~e and be Sued in the name of their 
Chairman Secretary or other Officer. 

7"Vic. No. 21 An Act to amend an Act intitnled "An The Water Police Act 
of 1843. Actfor the further and better re."ulation 

and gove-rnment of Seamen within the 
Oolon."1 of New Soltth Wales and its 
Dependencies and for establishing a 
1fTater Police"and further to amend 
the Law relating to the government of 
Sell-men in the Merchant Service. 

8 Vic. No. 2 An Act to regulate and amend the Lawof The Apprentices Act oj 
Orphan and other Apprt'ntices in the 1844. 
COlony of New 80uth Wales. 

11,Vic. No. 19 An Act for Facilitating the Winding-up The Oompanies (Wind-
of Joint Stock Companies unable to in/I-up) Act of 1847. 
meet their Pecuniary Engagements. 

11 Vie. No. 23 An Act for the protection of Seamen The Merchant Seamen 
entering on board Merchant Ships. Act of 1847. 

11 Vic. No .. 28 An Aet to facilitate the granting of The Leases Act of 

11 Vic. No. 41 

11 Vie. No. 44 

leases. 1847. 

An Act to Enable the Governor of the 
Colony to Cancel Appnintments of 
Places for holding Courts of Petty 
Sessions. 

An Act to Amend the" Act for re.9ulating 
the Police in the Towns of Parramatta 
Windsor Madland Bathurst and other 
Toyms respectively and for removin." and 
preventing Nuisances and Obstructions 
ana for the better alignment of Streets 
thth-ein." 

The Oourts of Petty 
Sessions Act of 1848. 

The Police Act Amend
ment Act oj 1848. 



1903. 

Year and Number. 

11 Vic.No. 56. 

11 Vic. No. 57 

11 Vic. No. 59 

13 Vie. No. 20 

13 Vie. No. 28 

ACTS. 

Acts Shortening Act Amendment Act. 

FIRST SCHEDUJ~E-confinued. 

SHORT TITLEs-continued. 

Title. 

An Act to Enable any Joint Stock Com
pany to sue any of its own Mt'mberR and 
to Enable any Member of any such Joint 
Stock Company to sue any such Com 
pany and for other purposeR. 

An Act to regulate the admis!<ion in 
certain cases of Barrister8 of the 
Supreme Court of New South Wales. ' 

An Act to enable certain Public 'HoRpita]s 
to Sue and be Sued in the Name of their 
Treasurer and to Provide for the Takiu~ 
and Holding of Real Property belonging 
to such Hospitals respectively. 

An Act to Amend an Act intituled "An 
Act to Enable certain Public Hospitali'l 
to Sill' and be Sued in the name of their 
Treasurer and to provide for the Taking 
and Holding of Real Property belonging 
to such Hospitals respectively." 

An Act to amend and consolidate the Laws 
relating to Seamen in the Merchant 
Service of the Colony of Sew South 
Wales and for keepiilg a Register of 
Seamen belonging to Ships registered in 
the said Colony. 

8605 

Shott Title: ' 

The Oompanies· (Pro
cess) Act of 1848. 

The Barristers Act of 
1848. 

The Hospitals Act of 
18<),7. 

The Hospitals Act 
Amendment Act of 
1849. 

The Merchant Seamen 
Act of 1849. 

13 Vic. No. 37 An Act for regulatin~ the trade or bu!!i- The Pawnbrokers .dct 

13 Vie, No. 47 

14 Vie. No. 7 

ness of Pawnbrokers in New South ol1849. 
Wales. 

An Act to transfer certain dutieR with 
respect to the printing and publishing 
of Books and Newspapers from the 
office of the Colonial Secretary to that 
of the Supreme Court. 

An Act for the Better Apprehension of 
Offenders who shall have escaped to 
parts within the Territory of ~ ew 
South Wales from any other of the 
Australian Colonies. 

The Pri'1ltin.'1 Acts 
Amendment Act of 
1849. 

The Fugitive Offenders 
Act of 1850. 

14 Vie. No. 9 An Act to Amend the Law concerning The Gaming Act of 
Games and Wagers. 1850. 



8606 

Year and Number. 

15 Vic. No. 4 

16 Vic. No. 4 

16 Vic. No. 15 

ACTS. 

Acts Shortening Act Amendment Act. 3 Enw. VII. No. 10, 

FIRST SCHEDULE-continued. 

SHORT TITLEs-continued. 

Title. 

An Act for the more effectual prevention 
of Vagrancy and for the punishment of 
idle and disorderly Persons Rogues and 
Vagahonds and incorrigible i{ogues in 
the Colony of New South Wales. 

An Act to Exempt the Sale of Books and 
other Publications from the Provillions 
of the Act relating to the Hawkers and 
Pedlers. 

An Act to Fix a Survev Mark to be used 
on Surveys conduct~d for the Govern
ment and to Prohibit the Unauthorised 
Use of such MarkR and for the Pre-
8ervation of Official Land Marks and 
Beacons. 

Short Title. 

The Vagrant Act of 
1851. 

The Hawkers and 
Pedlers Act Amend
ment Act of 1852. 

The Sur/Jell Narks Act 
of 1852. 

16 Vic. No. 25 An Act for more effectually Preventing The Merchant Seamen 
De8ertioll and other MiRconduct of (Foreign) Act oj 
Seamen belonging to Foreign Ships. 1852. 

16 Vic. No. 31 An Act to make it Compulsory on Persons The Walking to Prison 
under Committal to Prison to Proceed AlJt of 1852. 
thither on Foot when required. 

16 Vic. No. 34 An Act to Amend the Laws relating to The Weights and Mea. 

16 Vic. No. 37 

16 Vic. 

Weights and Measures. sures Act of 1852. 

An Act to enable the Prothonotary of the 
Supreme Court or his Deputy to perform 
cprtain duties with respect to the 
printing and publishing of Books and 
Newspapers. 

I 
An Act to amend an Act intituled "An 

Act to Incorporate the Proprietors of a 
certain Banking Company called 'The 
Bank of New South Wales' and for other 
purposes therein mentioned." 

The Printing Acts 
Amendment Act of 
1852. 

The Bank of New South 
Wales Act Amend
ment Act of 1852. 

17 Vic. No. 3 An Act for the Better Prevention of The Onttle Stealing 

17 Vic. No. 36 

Cattle Stealing and the Sale of Stolen Prevention Act oj 
Cattle 1853. 

An Act to amend the Laws relating to the 
engagement discharge and desertion of 
Seamen and for the regulation of 

. Seamen's Lodging-houses and for the 
better management of the Water Police 
Department. I 

The Water Police Act 
oj 1853. 



1903. 

Year and Number. 

17 Vie. 

18 Vic. No. 10 

ACTS. 

Acts Shortening Act Amendment Act. 

FIRST SCHEDULE-llontinued. 

SHORT TITLEs-llontinued. 

Title. 

An Act to Authorise the Conveyance of 
all Lands vested in Trustees on behalf of 
the Wesleyan Methodist Society by the 
Trustees thereof upon the Trusts con
tained in the Model Deed of the said 
Society. 

An Act to Authorise the Resumpt.ion or 
Occupation and Use of any Lands re
quired for Purposes of Military Defence 
and to make Compensation to the Owners 
thereof. 

8607 

Bh on Title. 

The Wesleyan Metho
dists Trost Property 
Allt oj 1853. 

The Military Lands 
Allt 0/1854. 

18 Vic. No. 27 An Act for Protecting Inclosed Lands from The Inclosed Lands 
Intrusion and Trespass. Act of1854. 

18 Vic. An Act to Amend an Act intituled " An 
Act to Amend an Act intituled 'An Act 
t9 Incorporate the Proprietors of a 
certain Ba.nking Company l'alleil The 
Bank of New South Wales' and for 
other purposes therein mentioned." . 

The Bank of New South 
Wales Ad .Amend
ment ..dct 0/1854. 

19 Vic. No. 3 An Act to Regulate the Currency in New The Ourrency Act of 
South Wales. . 1855. 

19 Vic. No. 8 An Act to apply to Newcastle and to Other 
Ports as occasion lDay require the Pro
visions of "The Water Police Regula
tion Act of 1853" respecting Seamen's 
Lodging-houses. 

The Water Police Act 
of 1855. 

19 Vic. No. 19 An Act to Prevent the Adulteration of The Liquor Adultera-
Spirituous and Fermented Liquors. tion Act 0/1855. 

19 Vie. No. 22 An Act for the Regulation of the Crews The Naval Defence Act 
of Armed Vessels in the Service of the of 1855. 

19 Vic. No. 24 

19 Vic.N o. 34 

Colony. 

An Act to make Further Police Regula
tions for the City Port and Hamlets of 
Sydney and other Towns and Places in 
the Colony of New South Wales. 

An Act for Registering Births Deaths 
and Marriages. 

The Polille Act of 
1855. 

Tke Registf'ation 0/ 
Birtks Deatks and 
Marria,qes Act of 
1855. 



860S ACTS, 

Apts Shortenin.lf .dct Amendment Act. 3 EDw. VII. No. 10, 

FIRST Se RE DiULE-contiaued. 

SHORT TrrLEs-,-continued. 

Yaar and Number,. Title . 

. ~.---.--- ---------------~I---------

20 Vic. No. 3 

20 Vic. 

22 Vic. No. 6 

27 Vic. No. 13 

An Act for the Payment of CORts in Pro
ceedings Instituted on behalf of the 
Crown in matterR relating to the 
Revenue and for the Amendment of 
the Procedure and Practice in Crown 
Suits. 

The Oosts in Orown 
Suits Act of 1856. 

An Act to incorporate "The Australian The Australian Mutual 
Mutual Provident Society." Provident Sociei;''I 

Act of 1857. 

An Act to Amend the Act for the 
Maint!'nance of Deserted Wives and 
Children. 

An Act to declare the trusts of the site of 
the Ipswich Mechanics' School of Arts 
and for other purposes therein con
tained. 

The ])eserted 1JTives 
and Ohildren Aet 
Amendment Act of 
1858. 

The Ipswich School ot 
Arts Act of 1863. 

28 Vie. No. 3 An Act to provide for the Erpction of The Brisbane Public 
Parliamentary and other Public Build- Buildings Act of 
ings within the City of Brisbane. 1864. 

28 Vie. No. 7 An Act to Consolidate and Amend the The Auctioneers Act of 

28 Vic. 

29 Vic. No. 18 

Laws relating to Licemed Auctioneers. 1864. 

An Act to amend an Act intituled "An 
Act to incorporate the Proprietors of a 
certain Banking Company I!alled 'The 
Bank of N ew ~outh Wales' and for 
other purposes therein mentioned." 

An Act to Grant Facilities for the Pur
chase of Small Government Annuities 
and for Assuring Payments of Money on 
Death. 

The Bank of New South 
1JTales Act Amend
ment Act of 1864. 

The Government An
nuities Act of 1865. 

29 Vie. No. 19 An Act for transferring to the Govern- The Hospitals Ad if 
ment the Management of Hospitals in 1865. 
certain cases. 

34 Vie. No. 12 An Act to Extend the Operation of Prefer- The Mercantile Act 
able Liens upon Certain Crops Amendment Act of 

1870. 

40 Vie. An Act to authorise the Queensland 
National Bank Limited to open and keep 
Registers of Shareholilers in places 
beyond this Colony. 

The I Queensland Na" 
tional Bank Act 
of 1876. 



ACTS. 8609 

1903.' Acts Shortening Act Amendment Act. 

FIRST SCHEDULE-conti'(1,utd. 
SHORT TITLEs-continued. 

---------- ----------'--~ ~ ~ - ~----~--~---~~~--~~-

Year and Number. Title. Short Title. 

41 Vie. No. 16 An Act to Amend "The Native Birds Pro- The lVative Birds Pro-

43 Vie. No. 1 

50 Vic. No. 6 

52 Vic. No. 7 

52 Vie. 

62 Vie.No.n 

64 Vic. No. 7 

38 Vic. No. 12 
47 Vic. No. 9 

54 Vic. No. 15 

59' Vic. :No. 13 

55 Vic. No. 23 
60 Vie. No. 11 

tection Act of 1877." tection Act Amend
ment Act of 1877. 

An Act to provide that certain Islands in 
Torres Straits and lying between the 
Continent of Australia and the Island of 
New Guinea shall beeome part of the 
Colony of Queensland and subject to the 
Laws in force ther~in. 

The Queensland Ooast 
Islands Act of 1879. 

An Act to further Amend "The Pacific The Pacific Island La-
Island Labourers Aet of 1880" I bourers Act Amend-

ment Act of 1886. 

An Act to Amend "The Public Works The Public Worh 
Lands .Resumption Act of 1878." Lands Resumption 

Act of 1888. 

An Act to confer Powers upon the Queens- The Queensland Trus-
land Permanent Trustee, ExecutOr, and tees Limited Act. 
Finance Agency Company, Limited. I, 1888 ~ 

An Act to Repeal "The Townsville Muni- IThe :t0ll.nsville Muni-
cipal Loan Act of 1897." , cipal Loan Act Re-

pealing Act of 1898. 

An Act to Correct certain Errors iu "The The Oriminal Oode 
Criminal Code Act, IH99." OO/'rection of Errors 

dct of 1900. 
i 

SECOND SOHEDULE. 
COLL,ECTIVE TITLES. 

Short Title. Collective Title. 

The Audit Act of 1874. I 
The Auditor- General (Salar;lJ) A()t I 

of 1884. Th .. d't 
The Audit Act Amendment Act of ~ e.aU t 

11'90 I 1895. 
The Audit Act Amendment Act of 

1895. ) 

Acts, 1874 to 

The Bi~ls of, Sale Act of 1891. -I ' 1 The Bills of Sale Acts, 1891 
The BtUs of Sale Act Amen"mcnt t 1896 

Act of 1896. 0 . 



8610 

Year and Number. 

51 Vie. No. 2 

56 Vie. No. 6 

62 Vie.N o. 13 

31 Vie. No. 35 
31 Vie. No. 42 

34 Vie. No. 26 

41 Vie. No. 14 

54 Vie. No. 21 

50 Vie. No. 24 
52 Vie. No. 3 

24 Vie. No. 7 
28 Vie. No. 8 

55 Vie. No. 5 

64 Vie. No. 30 

11 Vie. No. 59 
13 Vie. No. 20 

26 Vie. No. 1 
29 Vie. No. 19 
55 Vie. No. 35 

46 Vie. No. 7 
48 Vie. No. 18 

50 Vie. No. 8 

51 Vie. No. 5 

31 Vie. No. 34 
41 Vie. No. 20 
48 Vie. No. 24 
62 Vie. No. 3 

ACTS. 

Acts Shortening Act Amendment Act. 3 Enw. VII. No. 10, 

SECOND SCHEDULE-continued. 

COLLECTIVE TITLEs-continued. 

Short Title. Collective Title. 

The Oopyr£ght Registration Act l 
(Queenslnnd) , 1887. ffl'h rv . h 7 

ffl'h rv . ht (Fi A t-) R' L L, e uop.1fn.'1 t Acts, 188 to -'-, e l.iOpyrtg ne LLr s e.'1ls- r 1898 
tration Act, 1892. I' 

The Oopyright Re.'1istration Act, 1898. ) 

Disease.~ in Sheep Act of186'i. 
The Diseases in Sheep clet of 1867 

Amendment Act. . 
The Diseases in Sheep Act of 1867 

I Further Amendment Act .. 
The Diseasf's in Sheep Act Amt!nd

ment Act of 1877. 
The Diseases in Sheep Act Amend

ment Act of 1890. 

') 

l T'" DU .. ".;" 8A"p ""to, r 1867 to 1890. 

) 

The Employers Liability Act of 1886. 1 The Employers' L~ability 
Thp, Emplo.1Jers Liability Act Ea:- Acts, 1886 to 1888. 

tension Act (Seamen), 1888. 

Grammar Schools Act 1860. 
Grammar Schools Act Amendment 

Act of 1864. 
fit! Grammar Schools Act Amend

ment Act, 1891. 
The Grammar &hools Act Amend

ment Act, 1900. 

1 Th. G,~ &""'1. Ad, I 1860 to 1900. 

) 

The Hospitals Act of 1847. "I 
The Hospitals Act Amendment Act I 

of 1849. ~ The Hospitals Acts, 1847 to 
The Hospitals Act of1862. I 1891. 
The Hospitals Act of 1865. I 
The Hospitals Elections Act of 1891. j 

The Immigration Act of 1882. "I 
The Immigration A ct of 1882 I 

Amtndment Act of 1884. . . 
T.'h T. • t' At,/-, 1882 L The Immzgratzon Acts, 1882 

e .Lmmz.'1ra zon LLC oJ r to 1887 
Amendment Act of 1886. I . 

The Immi.'1ration Act Amendment 
Act of 1887. ) 

The Jury Act of 1867. 
The Jurors Act of 1877. 
'IheJur.1f Act of 1884. 
The Jury Act of 1898. 

~ TA, Jury A,,,, 1867" 1898. 

50 Vie. No. 17 The Justices Act of1886. 1 Th J t' A 1886 
56 Vie. No. 23 I The Justices Act Amendment Act of t89;s zces cts, to 

1892. . 



11)03. 

"¥,ear and Number. 

-54 Vie. No. 9 

61 Vie. No. 2 

28 Vie. No. 29 

·39 Vie. No. 13 

<61 Vie. No. 6 

31 Vie. No. 36 
.34 Vie. No. 12 

060 Vie. No. 10 

41 Vie. No. 7 

41 Vie. No. 16 

48 Vie. No. 12 

31 Vie. No. 12 
40 Vie. No. 10 

48 Vie. No. 19 

.55 Vie. No. 14 

48 Vie. No. 13 

.50 Vie. No. 5 

.54 Vie. No. 8 

2 Vie. No. 2 
11 Vie. No. 44 

19 Vie. No. 24 
27 Vie. No. 11 
45 Vie. No. 12 

49 Vie. No. 2 

.55 Vie. o. 32 

ACTS. 8611 

Acts Shortening Act Amendment Act. 

SECOND 8CHEDULE-continued. 

COLLECTIVE TITLEs-continued. 

Short Title. Collective Title. 

~~ .----~-----

Women's The Married 
Act, 1~90. 

Property J 
The Married Women's Pro-

The Married 
Act, 1897. 

Property perty Acts, 1890 to 1897. 

The Mat·timonial Causes JurisdictIOn "I 
Act of 1864. 11 

The Matrimonial Causes Act of. ~ The Matrimonial Causes 
1875. I Acts, 1864 to 18D7. 

The ltIatrimonial Causes Act of I 
1897. j 

The Mfrcantile Act of 1867. I 
The Mercantile Act Amendment Act I T·h M t ·z 

If 1870 ~ e ercan z e Acts, 1867 
T;e Merc~ntile Act Amendment Act, to 1896. 

of 1896. ) 

The Native Bird Protection Act of I 
1877. I 

The Native Birds Protection Act ~ The Natz've Birds Protection 
Amendment Act of1877. I Acts, 1877 to 1884. 

The Native Birds Protection Act I 
Amendment Act of 1884. j 

Oaths A.ct cf 1867. "I 
The Oaths Act Ame1~dment Act of I 

1876. Th 0 th 
The Oaths Act Amendment Act of ~ :891 a s 

1~84. I . 
The Oaths Act Amendment Act of 

Acts, 1867 to 

1891. ) 

The Patents, Designs, and Traae l 
Marks Act, 1884. Th PD' 

The Patents Designs and Trade e atents, eszgns, aniJ 
Marks (A:nendment) Act, 1886. r ;r~de Marks Acts, 1884 

The Patents, Designs, and Trade I 0 890 . 
Marks (Amendment) Act, 1l:l90. ) 

The Police Act of 1838. '1 . 
The Police Act Amendment Act of 

1848. 
The Police Act of 1855. 
The Police Act of1863. Th P r A 
The Police Jurisdiction Extension ~ :8910 we cts, 1838 to 

Act of1881. .. 
The Police Officer.s' Reliif Act of I 

1885. I 
The Police Act of 1863 Amendment 

Act of 1891. ) 



8612 

Year and Number. 

8 Geo.IV.No. 2. 
8 Geo. IV. No. 5 
2 Vie. No. 20 

5 Vie. No. 19 

13 Vie. No. 47 

16 Vie. No. 37 

60 Vie. No. 15 
1 Edw. VII. 

No. 17 

47 Vie. No. 1 

47 Vie. No. 4. 

1 Edw. VII. 
No. 5 

25 Vie. No. 14 
41 Vie. No. 18 
48 Vie. No. 4 
51 Vie. No. 3 

31 Vic. No. 2~ 
48 Vie.' No. 11 

59 Vic. No. 10 

25 Vie. No. 13 

31 Vie. No. 23 
87 Vie. No. 5 
38 Vie. No. 3 
52 Vie. No. 2 
53 Vie. No. 17 
55 Vie. No. 37 
56 Vie. No. 10 

57 Vie. No. 17 
59 Vie. No. 21 
63 Vie. No, () 
1 Edw. VII. 

No. 2 

15 Vie. No. 4 
27 Vie. No. 10 

ACl'S. 

Acts Shortening Act Amtndment Act. 3 Enw. VII. No. 10, 

SECOND SC HEDULE-continued. 
COLLECTIVE TITLEs-continued. 

Short Title. 

The Printing Act of 1827. ') 
The Printing Act of 1827 ( No. 2.) I 
The Printing Acts Amendment .det I 

of1838 

Oollective Title. 

The Printin.g Acts Amendment Act L The Printing Acts, 1827 to 
of 1H42. 'I 11:l52. 

The Printin.f! Acts Amendment Act 
of 1849. I 

The Printing Acts Amendment Act 
of 1852. j 

The Public Service Act of1896. 1 m1 P bl' Cl • 
"''h Fbi' S . cl Llle u tC oerVlce 
-L, e u le erezce Act Amen ,ment 1896 t 1901 

Act of 1901. 0 . 

Acts, 

" The Quemsl(fnd Stock Inscription 
Act (If 1883. 

The Queensland Stock Inscription 
Act Amendment Act (If 1884. 

I The Queensland Stock In-
r scription Acts, 1883 to 

The Queensland Stook Inscription 
LIct Amendment Act of 1901. 

J 1901. 

Real Property Act of 1861. 
The Real Propert,lI Act of1877. 
The Re,qistrar of Titles Act of 1884. 
The Real Property (Local Regis-

1 The Real Property Acts, 
I 1861 to 1887. 

tries) Act of1887. 

Succession Act of 1867. 

J 
') 

The Succession Act Declarator.1f Act 
of1884. ~ The Succession Acts, 1867 

I 101895. The Succession Act Amendment Act 
of 1895. ) 

The Supreme Oourt Oor.stitution-; 
Amendment Act (If 1861. 

Supreme Court Act of 1867. 
. The Actin.f! Judges Act of 1873. 
The Supreme Court "'lct of 1874. 
The Ju~ge8' Validafin.f! Act of1888. 
The Supreme Cou1t Act of 1889. 
The Supreme Oourt Act of 1892. 
The Supreme Court Act of 1892 

(No. 2). , 

I 
I 
I~ The Supreme Court 

1861 tl) 1901. 

I 
The Supreme OO'urt Act of 1893. 
The SUIJreme Oourt Act of 1895. 
The Supreme Oourt Act of 1899. 
The OhiejJustice's Salar.Y Ac! 

1901. 
of I 

) 

4cts, 

Va.qrant Act Amendment Act if The Vagrant Acts, 1851 to 
The Vagrant Act of 1851. 1 

1863. 0 1863. 



ACTS. 8613 

1903. Acts Shortening Act Amendment Act. 

THIRD SCHEDULE. 

Enactment. 

4 Vic. No. 13 (Banking Companies 
Accounts)-

Schedule A ... 

11 Vic. No. 28 (Real Property
Leases)-

Schedule II. 

18 Vic. No. 25 (Savings Banks)
Section 7 

22 Vic. No. 1 (Titles to Land)
Section l~ .,. 

22 Vic; No. 6 (Deserted Wives and 
Children)-

Section 13 ... 
25 Vic. No. 14 (Real Property)

Section 3 ... 

" 

" 
" 

" 

" 

" 

" 

" 
" 

36 ... 
37 ... 
64 ... 

66 ... 

72 ... 

91 ... 
112 ... 

123 ... 

124 ... 

27 Vic. No. 4 (Companies)
Section 47 (1) 

B 

Section 123 (3) 

A.fter Section 192 
Section 193 (4) 

Schedule I., Table A (78) 

Amendment. 

In the " Assets" column, for "Balances due to 
other banks" substitute "Balances due 
from other banks." 

In column 2, clause 12, for "lessor do hereby" 
substitute" lessor doth hereby"; and after 
the word "assigns," where it first occurs, 
insert "covenant with the said lessee his. 
executors administrators and assigns." 

Omit marginal note and Rubstitute the follow-· 
ing :-" Receipts by trustees on behalf of 
bank." 

For "taken under such instrument" substitute: 
"taking under such instrument." 

Omit" as Amended by the Act of1858." 

Tn the definition of "Certificate of title" omit 
the word "with." 

For "interest to which the shall appear" sub
stitute "interest to which he shall appear." 

Omit the second sentence in the marginal note. 
In the marginal note, for "Registrar-General" 

substitute" Treasurer." 
In the provi~o, for "trusts effecting the said 

debt" substitute "trusts affecting the said 
debt." 

In the marginal note, for "of registry book" 
snbAtitute "in register book." 

In the first line, for "to be hereinafter entered 
up" substitute "to be hereafter entered up." 

In the first paragraph, for "required be 
acknowledged" substitute "requir€d to be 
acknowledged." 

In the marginal note, for "act of ejectment" 
substitute "action of ejectment." 

In the marginal note, for the word "for" sub
stitute "of." 

After "required to be in writing" insert" and 
under seal." 

For "person or person" substitute "persons or' 
person." 

For "Part VIII." substitute" Part VII." 
In the first line of this subsection, after "this" 

insert "A.ct." 
For "takes place" substitute "take place." 



8614 ACTS . 

.lets Shortening Act A.mendment Act. 3 Enw. VII. No. 10, 

THIRD SCHEDULE-continued. 

Enactment. 

~------ --------

27 Vie. No. 8 (Railways)
Section 57 ... 

" 
71 ... 

" 
100 .. , 

,. 115 .. . 

" 
142 .. . 

27 Vie. No. 10 (Vagrants)
Section 2 

28 Vie. No. 15 (Marriage)
Section 24 .. , 

28 Vie. No. 24,(Railways)
Section 1 

Amendment. 

For " included therein all reasonable 'charges" 
substitute "including therein all reasonable 
charges." 

For "they shall be entitled to immediate pos
session thereof" substitute "the Com
missioner shall be entitled to immediate 
pos~ession thereof." 

For "place which they shall have set apart" 
substitute "place which he shaH have set 
apart." 

For "Commissioners" substitute "Commis-
. " SlOner. 

For" Company" substitute "Commissioner." 

Omit" (0/15 Victoria No. 4)." 

For "proceeding" substitute "proceedings." 

For "clause four" substitute "the fourth 
section" j and for "the said clauses of the 
said recited Act or any of them" substitute 
"the said fourth section of the said recited 
Act." 

28 Vie. (Brisbane Gas Oompany)-
Section 14... After "such deposits or instalments" omit 

" 
27 ... 

" 
31 ... 

" 
35 ... 

" 
37 .. , 

30 Vie. No. 11 Crreasury Notes)
Section 2 ... 

31 Vie. No. 4 (Common Law Pro
cess) 

Section 44 

31 Vie. No. 5 (Commou Law Plead
ing) 

31 Vie. No. 6 (Acts Shortening)
Section 12 ... 

" or" and insert "are." 
A.fter "to the satisfaction of the corporation 

or" omit "either" and insert" other." 
For" whomsoever" substitute "whosoever." 
For "the Government of the said town sur

veyor" substitute "the Government or the 
said town surveyor." 

For" grant" substitute "granted." 

For "twenty-five Victoria number thirteen" 
substitute "twenty-five Victorire number 
fifteen." 

Omit from marginal notes references to "Pring's ' 
Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 

For "indorsement and affidavits was" sub
stitute "indorsements and affidavits were" 

Omit from the marginal notes references to 
"Pring's Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 

In the definition of "circuit court," for 
"section twenty-eight" substitute "section 
thirty." 



ACTS. 8615 

1903. Acts Shortl1ni1l{! Act Amendment Act. 

THIRD SCHEDULE-continued. 

Ilnactment. 

,31. Vic. No. 9 (Probate) 

Section 11 

" 
89 

" 
42 .•. 

31 Vic. No. 11 (Interdict) ... 

Section 

" 

3 ... 

32 ... 

31 Vic. No. 12 (Oaths) 

31 Vic. No. 13 (Evidence) ... 

Section 

" 

" 

" 

" 
" 

" 

" 

" 

3 ... 
4 ... 

16 ... 

21 ... 
24 ... 
39 ... 

70 ... 

71 .. , 

72 ... 

31 Vic. No. 14 (Joinder) 

31 Vic. No. 16 (Distress, &c.) 

Section 30 ... 

" 
76 ... 

" 132 ... 
" 136 ... 

Schedules 

31 Vic. No. 17 (Common' Law 
Practice) 

Section 10 ... 

t',· 

Amendment. 

Omit from marginal notes references to "Pring's 
Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 

For "in case or default" substitute "in case 
of default." 

Before "such probate" insert "under." 
In the marginal note, for" s. 3" substitute 

" s. 30." 
Omit from marginal notes references to "Pring"s 

Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 
In marginal note, for "c. 16, s. 2" substitute 

" c. 15, s. 2." 
In marginal note, for "c. 5 " substitute" c. 58." 

Omit from marginal notes references to "Pring's 
Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 

Omit from marginal notes references to "Pring's 
Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 

In proviso, for" other" substitute" order." 
Omit "matter question or injury or of the" 

and substitute "matter or question or in 
any inquiry arising in any." 

In marginal note to second paragraph, for" 25 " 
substitute "22." 

In marginal note for "12 and 16," substitute 
" 15 and 16." 

In marginal note for "s. 26," substitute" s. 27." 
For" leading document" su.bstitute "legal docu

ment." 
Omit marginal note and substitute marginal 

note to s. 72. 
Omit marginal note and substitute marginal 

note to s. 70. 
Omit marginal note and substitute marginal 

note to s. 71. 

Omit from marginal notes references to "Pring's 
Statutes" a.nd to Colonial Acts. 

Omit from marginal notes references to "Pring's 
. Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 
For" mortgaged money" substitute "mortgage 

money." 
After the word "tender," where it first occurs, 

insert "of." 
In marginal note, for" 22," substitute" 212." 
In marginal note, for "126," substitute" 216." 
Omit marginal notes. 

Omit from marginal notes references to Cary's 
and Pring's Statutes and to Colonial Acts. 

In marginal note, for "tenant pur autre vie" 
substitute "cestui que vie." 



8616 ACT~t 

Acts Shortenin.fJ Act Amendment Act. 3 EDW. VII. No. 10, 

THIRD SCHEDULE-continue~. 

Enactment. 

31 Vic. No. 18 (Equity) 

Section 72 ... 

31 Vic. No. 19 (Trustees) ... 

Section 22 ... 

. , 53 ... 

31 Vic. No. 20 (Costs) 

Section 30 ... 

31 Vic. No. 21 (Legislative Assembly) 

31 Vic. No. 22 (Frauds and Limita
tion@) 

31 Vic. No. 23 (Supreme Court) ... 

31 Vic. No. 24 (Succession) 

Section 1 ... 

" 
26 .. . 

" 
67 .. . 

" 

Amendment. 

Omit from marginal notes references to "Pring' s 
Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 

In marginal note, for "c. 64, s. 3" substitute 
" c. 46, s. R." 

Omit from marginal notes references to "Pring's 
Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 

In marginal note, omit" 13 and 14 Vic. c. 60, 
s.19." 

In marginal note, omit" Such." 

Omit from marginal notes references to "Pring's 
Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 

For "and if such application" substitute "as 
if such application" 

Omit ftom marginal notes references to "Pring's 
Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 

Omit from marginal notes references to "Pring's 
Statutes" and to 28 Vic. No. 6. 

Omit from marginal notes references to " Pring's 
Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 

Omit from marginal notes references to "Pring's 
Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 

In the proviso, for <, fifteen" substitute 
" fourteen." 

For" mortgage" substitute" mortgagee." 

I In marginal note, for" c. 25, s. 15" substitute 
" c. 35, B. 13." 

In marginal notes, for "c. 38" substitute "c. 35." 
After the word" and" insert" correctlv." 

" 6f), 70 ... 
il ... 
74 ... 

" 
... For" and that this Act" substitute" and this 

Act." 

" 

" 

84 ... 

S5 ... 

For" and immediate conveyance "substitute" an 
immediate conveyance." 

For" hath been" substitute" have been." 

31 Vic. No. 27 (Summary Eject- Omit 'from marginal notes references to Cary's 
ment) Statutes and to 17 Vic. No. 10. 

31 Vic. No. 29 (Small Debts)
Section 2f) ... 

31 Vic. No. 33 (Medical) 

31 Vic. No. 34 (Juries) 

Section 18 ... 
" 34 ... 

Schedule I .••• 

Omit from marginal note <; 28 Vic. No. 29, 
B. 43." 

Omit from marginal notes references to "Pring's 
Statutes" nnd to Colonial Acts. 

Omit from marginal notes references to " Pring's 
Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 

In marginal note, for "c. 53" substitute "c. 50." 
Omit second marginal note. 
For" an.y arrangements has" substitute" any 

arran.qemenis have," and for" not less than 
thirty pounds" substitute "not less than 
fifty pounds." 



ACTS. 8617 

lU03. ..d.cts Shortening Act Amendment Act. 

THIRD SCHEDULE-continued. 

EnlWtment. Amendment . 

.3l Vie. No. 35 (Diseases in Sheep)-
Section 2..... .,. In the definition of "Clean Sheep," for "the 

Schedule hereto marked A" substitnte" the 

" 
17 .,. 

" 47 ." 

Schedule G .. ,. 

.31 Vic. No. 36 (Mercantile) 

Section 7 .•. 

.31 Vie. No. 38 (Constitution) 

.31 Vic. No. 39 (Repeals) 

.31 Vic. No. 42 (Diseases in Sheep) ... 

33 Vie. No. 10 (Pastoral Leases)-

Schedule hereto marked E." 
For "thing which" substitute "thing in 

which." 
In the marginal note, for" 45, 46, 47, and 48," 

substitute" 43,44,45, and 46." 
For "section 33" substitute "section 29." 

Omit from marginal notes references to " Pring's 
Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 

In. marginal note, for "c. 112" substitute 
"c. 111." 

Omit from marginal notes references to "Pring's 
Statutes" and to Colonial Acts . 

Omit from marginal notes references to "Pring's 
Statutes." 

In the third column of the Schedule correspond
ing to "Order in Council of 6th June, 
1859" in the first column, for" twenty-five" 
substitute" twenty-two." 

In the Preamble, for "ninety-second section," 
wherever the words occur, substitute 
" ninety -first section." 

Section 4... For " seventy-sixth" substitute " seventy-
seventh" 

.37 Vie. No. 9 (Evidence)
Section 1 ... .•. In marginal note, for "No. 10" substitute 

., No. 13." 
38 Vic. No. 5 (Insolvency)

Section 218 ... 

:38 Vic. No. 12 (Audit)
Section 40 ... 

After Section 47 

In marginal note, for "altered" substitute 
" ordered." 

For " ~ection thirty-four" substitute "sections 
thirty-four and thirty-five." 

For" Part Ill." substitute" Part IV." 

38 Vie. No.lS (CrownRemedies) ... Omit marginal notes to schedules . 

.39 Vic. No. 3 (Sheriff) 

.39Vic. No. 13 (Marriage)
Section 7 ... 

.(19 Vic. (Rockhampton Water
works)-

Section 23 ... 

Omitfrom marginal notes references to "Handy's 
Statutes" and to the corresponding sections 
of 31 Vie. No. 23 . 

In the third paragraph, for "discision" substitute 
" decision." 

In the marginal note, omit the words "or 
nullity." 

For" message" substitute" messuage." 



8618 ACTS. 

Acts 8hortenintJ Act Amendment Act. 3 EDW. VII. No. 10, 

THIRD SCHEDULE-continued. 

Enactment. 

40 Vie. No. 6 (Judieature)
Section 5 (2) 

41 Vic. No. 3 (Navigation) 

Section 144 ... 

41 Vic. No. 24 (Intestacy) 

Section 56 ... 

41 Vic. No. 25 (Marriage)-
Section 2 ... . .. 

41 Vie. (Ipswich Ohurch of Eng
land)-

Section 7 .•. 

41 Vic. (Ipswich Gas Companv)-
Section 4. . . . .. - .' . 

" 
9 ... 

42 Vic. No. 5 (Lands Resumption)-
Section 8 ... ... .. 

" 
" 
" 

18 ... 
38 .•. 

110 ... 

44 Vic. No. 10 (Railways),
Section 2 ... 

44 Vic. No. 17 (Pacific Islanders)-
Section 35 .. . 

" 
36 .. . 

46 Vic. No. 10 (Tramways)
Section 78 (1) 

46 Vic. No. 12 (Port Dues)
Sched. Ill .... 

Amendment. 

For "The Statute of Frauds and Limitations 
Act of 1867" substitute "'fhe Statute of 
Frauds and Limitations of 1867." 

Omit from marginal notes references to" Handy's 
Statutes" and to Colonial Acts. 

In the marginal note, omit "within one month.'~ 

Omit from marginal notes references to cor
responding sections of 31 Vic. No. 10 

For "31 Vie. c. 10" substitute "31 Vie. 
No. 10." 

1<'or " Bill " substitute" Act." 

For "Bill" substitute "Act" wherever the 
word " Bill" occurs. 

After" indenture" omit" indentures." 
Omit "for on bebalf of" and insert "for and 

on behalf of." 

'For "so far as the name shall be known" substi-
tute "so far as the same shall be known." 

In marginal note, for" s. 3 " substitute" s. 14.'~ 
In the marginal note, omit" Ib., s. 42." 
For" of any time" substitute" at any time." 

For "The Railway Act of 1872" substitute 
" The Railway Amendment Act of 1872." 

For" 1869 " substitute" 1866." 
Alter marginal note to read "Return to be sent; 

every six months." 

Alter the marginal note to read as follows ;
"Sections 28 to 32 and 49, to 61 may be varied 

or suspended by regulations." 

In marginal note, for "section 11" substitute 
" section 12." 

48 Vie. No. 10 (Bills of Exehange)-
Section 75 (3) For" drawer of" substitute" drawer or." 

48 Vic. (Bundaberg Gas Company)-
Section 41... . ••. 

48 Vie. (Gympie Gas Company) 

Section 24 ... 

1<~or "1878" substitute" 1884." 
Omit "Bill" and insert "Act" wherever the 

word " Bill " occurs . 
. After "such company of proprietors" omit; 

"of" and insert" or." 



ACTS. 8619 

1903. Acts Sho1'tenin.'I Act A,mendment Act. 

THIRD SCHEDULE-continued. 

Enactment. 

48 Vic. (Townsville Gas Company)
Section 38 ... 

49 Vic. No. 13 (Elections)
Section 70 ... 
Before Section 79 ... 

49 Vie. No. 18 (Liquor)
Section 128 ... 

50 Vie. No. 10 (Mineral Oils) 

50 Vie. No. 13 (Settled Land)
Section 55 .,. 

50 Vic. No. 19 (Mining Companies) 

Section 11 (4) 

50 Vic. No. 29 (Trade Unions)
Section 24 ... 

" 
25 ... 

" 
26 ... 

" 
29 ... 

" 
30 ... 

50 Vie. No. 30 (Liquor) 

53 Vie. No. 12 (Defamation
Section 36 ... 

" 46 '" 

53 Vie. No. 18 (Companies)-
Section 5 .. : ... 

" 
7,8 ... 

" 
18 ... 

54 Vie. No. 17 (Prisons)
Section 37 (5) 

Amendment. 

For" from to time" substitute "from time to 
time." 

In margmal note, for" of " substitute" or." 
In title of Part V., for "result and return" 

substitute" results and the return." 

In marginal note, for" three months" substitute 
"two months." 

Omit from marginal notes references to corres
ponding sections of 43 Vie. No. 9. 

For" under this settlement" substitute" under 
the settlement." 

Omit from marginal notes references to cor
responding sections of 39 Vic. No. 9. 

For" on his delivery to the Company" sub
stitute "on his delivering to the Company." 

In marginal note, for "Ibid., s. 3" substitute 
" Ibid., s. 2." 

In marginal note, for "lbid., s. 4" substitute 
" lbid., s. 3." 

In marginal note, for" Ibid., s. 5" substitute 
" Ibid., s. 4." 

In marginal note, for" Ibid , s. 21" substitute 
" Ibid., s. 22" 

In marginal note, for "Ibid., s. 22" substitute 
" Ibid., s. 23." 

Omit from marginal notes references to Colonial 
Acts. 

In marginal note, for "servants" substitute 
" employers." 

In marginal note, omit all words after "Slander 
of Title." 

In marginal note, for "Ib., s. 10" substitute 
" 30 & 31 Vic. c. 131, s. 10." 

In marginal notes, for "c. 126" substitute 
"c. 26." 

In marginal note, for "Ib., s. 4" substitute 
"42 & 43 Vie. c. 76, s. 4." 

For "unavoidable" substitute "avoidable." 



8620 ACTS. 

Aots Shortening Act Amendment Ad. 3 EDW. VII. No. 10, 

THIRD SCHEDULE-oontinued. 

Enactment. Amendment. 

J)4r Vie. No. 21 (Diseases in 
Sheep)

Section 2 ... In marginal note, for" 40 Vic. No. 9 and section 

55 Vic. No. 8 (Treasury Bills)
Preamble 

55 Vic. No. 23 (Bills of Sale)
Schedule 

39 of 31 Vic. No. 35" substitute "certain 
enactments. " 

For "The Victoria Bridge Aot of 1877" sub
stitute " The Victoria Bridge Act of 1876." 

In marginal note, for" 13" substitute" 12." 

55 Vic. No. 31 (Poisons)
Section 4 (1) .,. For" Schedule" substitute" First Schedule." 

55 Vic. No. 32 (Police)
Section 2 ... 

55 Vic. No. 33 (District Courts)
Section 175 ... 

55 Vic. No; 34 (Water Supply)-
Section 27... ... .. . 

56 Vic. No. 30 (Pastolj:\l Leases 
Extension)-

Section 9 ... 

57 Vic. No. 7 (Fisheries)
Section 2 ... 

5.V Vic. No. 20-
Section 10 

58 Vic. No. 12 (Co-operative Com
munities)-

Section 2 ... 

Transpose" one" and" who." 

For "on the application of the same party" 
substitute" against the lands or goods of 
the same party." 

For "Water Area" substitute "Irrigation 
Area." 

For" The Rabbit Boards Act of 1892" sub
stitute " The. Rabbit Boards Aot of 1891." 

For "such master or employer" substitute 
"his master or employer." 

For "The Treasury Bills Aot of 1893" substi
tute .. The l.'reasury Bills Act of 1893 
(No.2}." 

Omit" of the Principal Act as amended by this 
Act" and insert" of this Act." 

58 Vic. No. 17 (Friendly Societies)-
Section 24 (7) (0) ". For" Section twenty-nine ,. substitute" Section 

thirty-three." 
58 Vic. No. 27 (Agricultural Lands 

Purchase)- . 
Section 14 ... 

59 Vic. No. 7 (Supreme Court 
Funds)-

Section 9 ... 

" 
21 ... 

For "the Principal Act" substitute "The 
Grown Lands Aot rif 1884." 

For" in pursuance or this Act" substitute" in 
pursuance of this Act." 

In the last paragraph, omit "or necessary or 
. sufficient." 



ACTS. 8621 

1903. .A.ets Shortenin.r; Aet Amendment Aet. 

THIRD SCHEDULE-continued. 

Enactment. 

'60 Vie. No. 21 (Companies)-
Section 2... ... 

62 Vie. No. 21 (Brands)
Section 15 ... 

64 Vie. No. 28 (Faetories)
Section 5 (2) (4) 

64 Yic. No. 9 (Health)
Section 3 ... 

" 
" 

86 '" 
1:35 ... 

I Edw. VII. No. 20 (Life Assur
ance)-

Section 37 ... 

1 Edw. VU. No. 25 (Pastoral Hold
ings New Leases)-

Section 8 (1) (2) (3) 

Amendment. 

For" the provisions of the said Act" substitute 
" the provisions of the said Acts." 

For " fourth section" substitute "second 
section." 

For "Proclamation" where it occurs in these 
subsections substitute" Order ill Council." 

For "Common Lodginq-houses, !!fe.," substitute 
"Lodging-houses, !!fe." 

Omit the figure 1 in brackets. 
For "Commissioners" substitute "Commis-

. " SlOner. 

For "one hundred and seventy" substitute 
" one hundred and seventy-one." 

For "clause five subsection four" substitute 
"section five subsection four," 

:2 Edw. VII. No. 10 (Income Tax)-
Section 79 '" ... ... In marginal note, for "three years" substitute 

" six months," 
:2 Edw. VII. No. 15 (Friendly 

Societies) -
Section 2.... ... . "I For" in the Principal Act" 

Act." 
:2 Edw. VII. No. 19 (Local Authori-

Bubstitute "in this 

ties)-
Section 52 ... 

Schedule II .... 

For "The District Courts Act of 1891" sub
stitute " The District Courts Act, 1891." 

1!'or " 58 Vie. No. 24" substitute" 5b Vic. No. 
22" ; and for" 61 Vie. No. 17" substitute 
" 61 Vie. No. 19." 

:2 Edw. VII. No. 26 (Treasury 
Bills)-

Section 5 ... In marginal note, omit the words "Date of 
Bills and." 

APPROPRIATION ACTS. 
See . CONSTITUTION. 




